
County of Santa Barbara
Purchasing Agent
260 N San Antonio Rd,
Santa Barbara, CA 93110

Order E8359

Order date
5/21/2024

Delivery address
Santa Barbara County
PW ROADS, MANAGEMENT SUPPORT
123 E ANAPAMU Ste 205
SANTA BARBARA, CA
93101
GENA VALENTINE-FELIZ
805-568-3064

Vendor
201444
SAM HILL & SONS INC

PO BOX 5670
Ventura
CA
93005
Caleb Litten
805-644-6278

Bill To
Santa Barbara County
123 E. ANAPAMU STE 205 SANTA BARBARA, CA 93101 805
568-3003

Refer Inquiries to Buyer
Sean Burns
seburns@countyofsb.org

Terms of payment
30 days

Item/Comments Description Preferred
delivery date Quantity Unit Price Amount

000090- BRIDGING,
GUARDRAIL,
CULVERTS

RUSH - due to a rotted culvert and avoid loss
of the roadway. A bond is to be received by the
Vendor this week or by Monday 5/13/24.

2024-05-10 1.00 78,670.00 78,670.00

Order Total USD 78,670.00

GENERAL: Vendor to replace a rotted culvert on Refugio Road per attached SoW.

CONTRACT PERIOD: Start date, as directed. Termination date, as directed and NO LATER THAN 6/30/2025.

LIMITATIONS: Total expenditure for the period shall not exceed $78,670.00

SPECIFICATIONS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS (ver. 2024-04-08) APPLIES.

No contractor or subcontractor may be listed on a bid proposal for a public works project (submitted on or after March 1,
2015) unless registered with the Department of Industrial Relations pursuant to Labor Code section 1725.5 [with limited
exceptions from this requirement for bid purposes only under Labor Code section 1771.1(a)].

No contractor or subcontractor may be awarded a contract for public work on a public works project (awarded on or
after April 1, 2015) unless registered with the Department of Industrial Relations pursuant to Labor Code section
1725.5.
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This project is subject to compliance monitoring and enforcement by the Department of Industrial Relations.

Contractor and each subcontractor shall at all times have a valid Certificate of Reported Compliance, as described in
section 2449(n) of Title 13 of the California Code of Regulations, for each fleet of vehicles subject to 13 CCR section
2449 that may be used in performance of this Contract. No such vehicle is permitted on site unless and until Contractor
provides County with a valid Certificate of Reported Compliance applicable to such vehicle.

In accordance with Section 2-96 of the County Code, if complaint is made that seller is engaging in discriminatory
employment practices made unlawful by applicable state and federal laws, rules or regulations, and the State Fair
Employment Practice Commission or the Federal Equal Employment Opportunities Commission determines that such
unlawful discrimination exists, then the County of Santa Barbara may forthwith terminate this order.

Phung Loman
COUNTY OF SANTA BARBARA
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From: pwc100@dir.ca.gov
To: Sean Burns; Christian Garcia
Subject: Project Creation
Date: Tuesday, May 21, 2024 2:28:12 PM

Caution: This email originated from a source outside of the County of Santa
Barbara. Do not click links or open attachments unless you verify the sender and
know the content is safe.

Hello,

Thank you for using the PWC-100 online application.

This email confirms the submission of a new project titled "E8359" that was created on 21 May 2024 and
assigned DIR Project ID 525975.

Please share this DIR Project ID number with each contractor on the project. They will need this number
to submit certified payroll records into DIR's Electronic Certified Payroll Reporting(eCPR) database.

Thank you for your submission

Sincerely,

Public Works Program
Division of Labor Standards Enforcement
Department of Industrial Relations
State of California

mailto:pwc100@dir.ca.gov
mailto:seburns@countyofsb.org
mailto:CGarcia@countyofsb.org
















From: Caleb Litten
To: Lori Lynch
Cc: Udy Loza; Ashley Kruzel; Marika Ruh; Contract_1_80adb3de-f616-4e34-a32a-

510f209a9c4d@appmail.myprojecthq.com
Subject: RE: Sam Hill & Sons, Inc - 47 - E859 $76,670.00
Date: Friday, May 24, 2024 7:14:56 AM
Attachments: Sam Hill - Sons Inc - 47 - E859 05.21.24 _Signed.pdf

Caution: This email originated from a source outside of the County of Santa
Barbara. Do not click links or open attachments unless you verify the sender and
know the content is safe.

Lori,
 
Please see attached Contact with Bonds. I had to Redline Exhibit A, since we are using that for
signatures, I changed it to reflect the counties information, and changed the name for
signatory from myself to Spencer hill (I’m not an officer and cannot sign a contract like this)
 
If you have any questions or concerns, please let me know.
 
Thank You and Best Regards,
 
Caleb Litten
Cell: 805-432-5739
Office: 805-644-6278
Email: caleb@samhillandsons.com

 
From: Lori Lynch <lorilyn@countyofsb.org> 
Sent: Tuesday, May 21, 2024 2:51 PM
To: Caleb Litten <caleb@samhillandsons.com>
Cc: 'matt.porter@bbrown.com' <matt.porter@bbrown.com>; Udy Loza <uloza@countyofsb.org>;
Ashley Kruzel <akruzel@countyofsb.org>; Marika Ruh <Marikaruh@countyofsb.org>
Subject: Sam Hill & Sons, Inc - 47 - E859 $76,670.00

 
Hi Caleb,
 
Please review and sign the attached contract. One concern is the quote expires on 5/25/24. Is
going to be an issue as will Matt have the Bond in hand before the quote expires?
 
Please email me the signed contract so I can process it.
 
Thank you.
 

mailto:caleb@samhillandsons.com
mailto:lorilyn@countyofsb.org
mailto:uloza@countyofsb.org
mailto:akruzel@countyofsb.org
mailto:Marikaruh@countyofsb.org
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Lori Lynch,  MBA
Accountant III
Public Works – Transportation Division
County of Santa Barbara
123 E. Anapamu Street, Suite 205
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805-568-3004
lorilyn@countyofsb.org
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