Fire Department = Michael W. Dyer

Fire Chief
“Serving the community since 1926” County Fire Warden
HEADQUARTERS Christian J. Hahn

Deputy Fire Chief
4410 Cathedral Oaks Road
Santa Barbara, CA 93110-1042
(805) 681-5500 FAX: (805) 681-5563

Date: December 1%, 2010

To:  The Honorable Board of Supervisors

From: Richard Todd %‘}7’:—«5&
Division Chief/Fire Marshal

Subject: Underline-Strikethrough Copies of the Proposed Draft Ordinance/Chapter 15

Here are the Underline-Strikethrough copies of the proposed changes to Chapter 15 of the
Santa Barbara County Code which provides for the adoption of the 2010 California Fire
Code with amendments. This item is scheduled to be heard on Tuesday, December 7“’, in
Santa Barbara.

Serving the cities of Buellton, Goleta and Solvang, and the Communities of Casmalia, Cuyama, Gaviota, Hope Ranch, Los
Alamos, Los Olivos, Mission Canyon, Mission Hills, Orcutt, Santa Maria, Sisquoc , Vandenberg Village



Al ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 15 OF THE SANTA
BARBARA COUNTY CODE, ADOPTING THE 20072010
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE AND uppATNG THEA FIRE CODE FEE
SCHEDULE

ORDINANCE NO.

An ordinance of the County of Santa Barbara amendlng Chapter 15 of the
Santa Barbara County Code insludingto adopt the adeptic rrofthe 20072010
edition of the California Fire Code, regulating and governing the
safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising
from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and
devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the
occupancy of buildings and premises in the County of Santa Barbara;
providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefors.

The Board of Superviéors of the County of Santa Barbara, State of California, ordains as follows:

Section One

Chapter 15 of the Santa Barbara County Code is amended in the following manner:
1.Article |, entitled: “Adoption of the 28642007 California Fire Code” is deleted and
replaced with Article I, entitled “Adoption of the 20072010 California Fire Code™:

2 Article H entitled \I\i.:::.ad Abotement® is deleted A oross referense-is-ciled-io
V=AY, ")le‘fﬁ : Seo 15 '-’flf\ antitiad ”pl"ﬂ*‘ﬂ'r:i 7. Sacuiramante froe A el
7 Eate HOEE Cisal PG e S TeFRHHGER
Urban in rmr"ﬂhr\ Eire A I'Q’.IC‘ Articla 1 is resorved forfutura oo
SE e S P PR -H S,

M antitled “Aufamatin Tiee S rinldar Svctome” ie dAaiatad b _oree
PR RS HE—=H foFt YeAEgHeE—15—-G88ieg ) &
referepse—is—oited o nesg-Ardicle | Soe 48 (0 etitloe Y heantar 0O Eir
reretrence—i H I = G S e e SR SF H
-L:)IQT. o !nn Q\)fisfqmp" Art fal7=IAY o reconzand for & futura Hae:
5-2.Article V, entitled “Fees™is-amendad-ic :nfﬂrpc.ate”. incorporates a current
fees;
iire code fee schedule with no chanaes to the existing fee schedule, however

Art cle ¥V is amended to update ' angua

eferences to the California Fire Code.
3.Article VI entitted "Viciations-Legal Actions” is amended to update the reference
to the te@1201o CFC in Sec. 15-125 Citations — Enforcement procedures;

nchanged:

Fi lflr‘icx AV THI-Yet 21 ! “E:lrr\\mnrlfc ic rar
HHHS 8 HHes &«

el ben prmelemtes
eGP EE

;
of thic ordinznce and firaworks gl +
SR RaRee-2 H-ER

shall remain in effect.

Section Two



Chapter 15 of the Santa Barbara County Code is amended as follows:

Article l.

mc_x. -

Adoption of the 26872010 California Fire Code

Sec. 15-1. Adoption of 22872010 California Fire Code.

The beardBoard of supepssersSupervisors of the secuniy-County of Santa Barbara for the
purpose of prescrrbrng regulations governing conditions hazardous te life and property from fire,
hazardous materials or explosion, adopts the 20072010 edition of the California Fire Code
(hereinafter California Fire Code or "CFC") based on the 2008200% edition of the International
Fire Code, including Chapters 1-4749 and Appendix Chapters 4+-4, A, B, C, I, E, F, G, H and K]
as published by the Internatronal Code Council, except such portions as are added deleted,
modified or amended by sestienSec. 15-3 of thrs chapter A copy of the 2672010 edition of the
California Fire Code is on file with the slerkClerk of the hoardBoars of st isorsS Supervisors
and is adopted and incorporated by reference.

This Ordrnance shall be controlling it all areas within the lmits-stallarsas oithe-Santa Barbara
County #ie p'czestr -gistrstlire Proteclion District and by-agreementall olher unincorporated
areas of the County, except the areas within incerperated-arcasthe Carpenteria/Summerland Fire
Protection District, Montecito Fire Protection District, Vandenberg Air Force Base, and Bureau of
Indian Affairs Lands, unless otherwise specified by this shapterChapter.

Sec. 15-2. Rules of constenstienConsiruction.

(a) Wherever the word "jurisdiction” is used in the CFC; it isshall mean all areas within the Santa
Barbara County Fire Protection District and all other unincorporated areas of the Santa-EBarbara

Coopimiv fire
SEHHY—H

staction r‘?zo‘rrrh* abd by aoros

faYs afataks n%"\lr\ H‘H"r\rﬁf\r"‘? il arpooo  unloceo mathomaneco
=3 o oy gHes DTS

T T T O T T T e e [N o 1

{

speciied-by-this-chapler

County, except the areas within the Carpenteria/Summerland Fire Protection District,
Montecite Fire Protection Disirict, Vandenberg Air Force Base and Burezu of Indian
Affairs lands, uniess olherwise specified by this Chapter

(b) Whenever the words "chief* and/or “fire chief” of the fire department are used they shall be
held to mean the Santa Barbara County fire—ehietFire Chief, also known as “Hire-warden'the
"Fire Warden, or his of_her designee.”

(c) Whenever the words "building department" are used they shall be held to mean the buiiding

1

and-satety—drstenBuilding and Safety Division of the Santa Barbara County planning-and
dereloprret :ilsparfmC’:iEv'iarrnrm and Development Department.

(d) Whenever the words "police department” and "police” are used they shall be held to include
the esunty-shert-departmentSanta Barbara County Sheriff Depariment or the law enforcement
agency that has legal jurisdiction.

(e) Whenever the words "California Building Code" and "building code" are used they shall be
held to include the building code as adopted byunder Chapter 10 of the Santa Barbara County-
Code.

(_Whenever the words "California Electrical Code” are used it shall be held to include the
elecirical code as adopted under Chapter 10 of the Santa Barbara County Code

{1} Whenever the words "California Residential Code” and “residential code” are used they shall
be held to include the residential code as adopted under Chapter 10 of the Santa Barbara County
Code.

o
3
L




{g) Whenever the words "County Land Use and Development Code’ are used it shall he
held to include the County Land Use and Development Code adogted under Chapter 35 of
the Santa Barbara County C
(h) Whenever the WDI’dS ire_Protection Certificate” (FPC) are used it means the
application for review of any new building or structure that requires a puilding permit, any
residential building or structure Lhaf adds an sccumulation of 1000 scuare feet or more,
any commercial building or structure that adds an_accumulation of 500 square feet or
more, any commercial builging or structure that adds any square footage xceeding 5000
square feet, or the review of anvy changes to a fire protection system.

(i) Whenever the words “High Fire Hazard Severity Zone Maps® are used it means the
maps adopted under Chapter 10 of the Sants Barbara County Code and on file with the
Office of the State Fire Marshal

(1) Whenever the words "Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone Mans” are used # means
the maps adopted under Chapter 10 of the Sania Barbara County Code and on file with
the Office of the State Fire Marshal.

i
Q
s
=

i

(k) Whenever the words "Santa B“rbﬁ County Fire Department Development Standards®
are used it means those standards earg hecz ang developed by the Santz Barbara
County Fire Department, on file vvzth he fire code official and available for review and

reference at www . shcfire.com

Sec. 15-3. Amendments to the California Fire Code.

The California Fire Code is amended as follows in order to properly safeguard the health, safety,
and welfare of the people, property and environment of Santa Barbara County:
DIVISION H

(a) CHAPTER 2—DEEIITIONS-is amended-as follows:

b GENERA i :
L= 2 AL DERINITIONS end v-adding-the-followingtarms:
EIRE HAZARD Ay thino aroact that inr\rn cog ar coulnd coven an-increase-ofthe hozard
HL L S R e S L s = e T e LT e L e AR A ts T o R o ki 1 a T W T 251
or-menace of fire o o greater-dacrea than that ~uctamarily racacnizad ac nocee ol s
Sr—hReRrace—otH e g E T R g B e s CHSIOMA Y e e gRIZe e as-Reimai- oy
nareanc i tha molsdies mvire rootdarhe anemamad b eveonsantice tineaooinge s svwtivyes iebio ey
pErESTSTIESpaene ST Ee e gt -eRgagetih-prevendng - suppressing-or-exkinguishing
fice or gnuthing or act that conld mlbeteiint Aaloy bincdar A interbors it the anaratimne oF
HrETSTETT T g S et e GPw BSOSt Seay RGeS e ere-wWiin-the-operalions-of
ithe fire denartment ar the aarace nf ancunante in the sumnt of fien \Alhean o Bire Lloasard oo
e o pTh O e S e B Se e S oEGHPE R E- eVeR- o e A nen-a e Haozard has
been-daetarminad to aviet hy the Eira O hiaf tha Ciea azarsd all e soncidarodd de e o
Boeh-GOterHReeto-Existay-the—rire-Lhie—H S e Forn oS E-GoRSigeledSo-Be-a
Tyt
REHEARGE:
p;gﬁ_@é EEE-%EE E("-‘é EE E"ng‘“u 2l _for the nurames of thic made e deciamatos bue thee Dire
=220 1 uu.., FOFAE-PUHHRO Uit Cote 2 e-CEsigRaiEe Y- IHe—mife
Ohiaf ond inelid hut mot ha limitad te danbe  ~aminvocenre  miomnn vyaccale aoma stloe
e RERGHHEE—BU-RGTE OO o ST SO Pr eSS O 5P MBS YEEssIs —aRe-other
larne egpinment orstructiurae nartinant te ail fiald anarciinno eitand ok o cincle laentioe
T e S E e S GG PERIRERT0-CHBIG- 0 pBFaHERS-SH SR EE IR
T E B E’ F.!l e
BECTIOWN 204 adifil=1
R R Bag
2604 1 A Wafamte ragtarial_ic omended by ingariing the n!‘*r":-r\c B Afhen doetoerminad i ho firm
A SR FRERa s aFHEeRGEEY-REeHIRgR HE-GeteHHResHe-2e-a-
WMW%JW%MS
ey
3&%&—%@@@&&4@%% rensed-as-tellows:
BEayin na fhe rheaees Mihan determined to-be o fire bozard Voot e bheminavines of the
._.)- H u.g e GEteR RHEE - Be-g e REZare, SEe-REgHRHRE-8—Re
e Infarnatinnal Wildiand Intarfora. Cada” b aciicn
—tAS—AHOFAAHGRE HGH ARG~ FEE W >S86HOR

1 2TE MERGE mm%%ﬁgﬁ%fﬁ#%m%gwﬁe@@&dm
seeﬂen&esme,gt-theﬂ‘snewmg

EECTHOMN 401 GENERAL



B

1
i s

£k,

Ta IS W T =10

Y

2ES

Az

il

4

iy

4
s

pEp e A

o ¥atul et dmta

e

Tt

BTG

i

ments:

F

%
b3
TE

L

ABEAEATIIC A n o

LY

CTAORE B0 I

R

Ly

1§

13

LT

¥

T

Ega3 4

&

[atalm

fal Yl

ann nf e

Fhyey

5

e amancad

penene s el

{
i

o

47
U
ks

FTRSTII

TSI

T

T

i

i

1

§

T

W

&
by Eirs Doe

o

Lo R N oy i iy

HS

moont
Ht

fad

e

o~
3 0 R e

H

3

pine s
it

Ba

w

[ttt atate)
iR

=
TrI

(=g

RCETLE

+
t
nrnmnt Stoncdaeds ¥

R

FReha
rtrmmet Dol

TSR

TESEE
TS

(33
¥

ey

i
Barbhara (Caiimiyy Birs Miana

oo

e

LY

.

oy
o

imoc
2SS

t

1

not

1 s
Fat e
i

3

i tada

[aYal

g
T

-y

;

-

le mrmandoe
cHHERE

H

Agusnen
iy

T

aveent fare anmeony

[

sy
HHERER

e
(B0 rmen)

Ef 2 4

R~

TR
hs3

th

A3 &

AL

i

notec

,—-!:

Af

Sapti

i

VETLET

seonrdane

cenolariiv
oy

Ry

(A4 I A

e

ToTTiETereS

FEETTY EAA =2 =g

=Ras

Dlovalonmeant

FETTCTTL

(=2l

T

Tl I et e Ta T =
=

[y

Cmypedy
Sty

2 iy e
THTE

TET

b

E
U

et
W

nAconrsdances g
FGCOFGIRGE

i

T

1

o rmikraco
gt

tandards—=

o
st

g

renrlos e ey

T

by

L

loreimese et

TOATT

e

R ]

ATk alal

eSO

o
Gt

alobimes
arsanis

by

PorT s

foe o arnerris e
e et

£

£

BEvy gy
t

Security g

T

U

i

chait

fadaTalw

Syt o

¢
i

-y

antme o

ooy
&

SR

RSy

vt

HEa = ey e s e

!
=4

AT

5]

STICY

iretalloting
HEEHSHSeR

TS

M

(E=IEA=1=T1}

[CAREA=I N E

i

TEETITy

3
U
¢
n
g
§
Iai

-~

ity St
Hita-EarRala

it

VLT

Iy
St

tha

t

[Tl
L

i

g0

A und
i

mendond hy dolofina tha npiesbvere
oS EE— T tHe—-HHHREET

fe

idress

sentanca and ronlscimea thans

gv.ﬁ:"

i

TR T

=0

7

and Y78 BT reonoetisaly

TATHGCE

ey
oF

HonT et

L

Iyt el e

\ALHE
Vet

(22

OO

TCRT

t

T

oY

i)

dad-by

=

=
=

IA
Sy

i

]

3

iy

ater-suppl

t

TECTL O

it

08 EIREPRO

Bog4 R

¥

#

SECTICHW] EOn B

:

PV ntal

]

i

}

-
I,

&

&

-aading-t

]
]

tortinm yuntar o

3E

.

i i
H

Sa¥elal
55

into

Fa¥a Blae!
R

¢
]

Hoe
HA&EHIET

ITatasdes

be

shall

taro
Pt

retection-water-sudpph-5)

T

=1 ey
F

P
conrdanca uith Santa Barhars O

rorramh

LRSI ST

tho n

tondarde
Haarg

3

¥ (R

T

Y

tDovelnnmon
Hi-i

[ dantotal

T

Eire Pime

N+
VT LU S U g e o g e -y g oL A

©

CoTTTTT

F

[=A~T A= e

Ty

1o os fallmg

nf B TERAS o menmome
ot et

TETRE

FIRE DEOT

B G

£

AW ad 2T 4=

£

¥

EC

=

O T

TR

R TR

i =4

T

3

3

3

i

EE W

>

3

L2

A

sHevrines foremes
AR GRS

§

oy
HG-thRE
seopianc

vomrichinges t
=

by

ie arnonclocd
H—aHREREE

LR

Ar oreh

T

e

(32

602 DEFITIONS

A WA ERECS

P TR R

SRECTISR GO% Iy

=

It ~r

il Eideg
oSy

LY
vy

byt
bl

rrn; s

toebe

i

7
¥

athar nretaction

et

=4

[CARCEA A= s sy o

¥

S s
ey anrhisdy

P
te

Tatal
LER

t

g as

T

T

ST

nd
218,

[ MRS T Y Tu N a Yo

FAY
#

Fromby et
tterort

~

10
R

It
ey

cunnarted by tlhe

vazhsiig
WHAGHY

i
b

deraratinn

2w
T

hE-1

TEPY T

T

WY FTET T

e =23

TSy

T

T

T

T

S

o

bt

ORI TR

e

Ta¥al

aYa\ VT
Ty

o)
TE

VT

T

T F

on-struchure-overwhich

tFF

i oleals
ot

bt V]
TG

hwainht

R IR AS LT ay

dofall

fatatautalalols

ST

throo Ar

honndad an

bess

the

T

[atatayal

(WYl al ¥ =Vwnta S
HGG

A Anon

fadalii=ng

¥

BTt

annhotriotacd o

I TToS T Ty

Tt

[ a=a=2 a1

¥

o

LAy =4 =i

LR B~ A

7

5

e

£

LS i gy

¥ R}

t

athar anclocinag davyicoe

aamieas

TR

wists-or

cha

Iy piledim ey
S

yiorine
Y-S H

1

mmrs oo by

TS

- P
a0 4
i 1

sonkion
o

pea~=]

£

oY

T

o
a
<

is-arpendad
T =

o

H

G

MATIC SREIRIKE
iop-00

¥

ALTOMATIC

e

¥

T

TR RE B0

=

-

T

3

RE

o3
he]

ol
fadt
809 4

o

tha

P At amtagml

Tate)

£
£

e
T

Ve lailatal

io _omeandod by
S

g

romaral

v
T

]
< Ial
R~

tg

tay

ITaNYY

L (=]

¥

o

T

AR AR LA B A R IR = L)

o P
3 AR

b

=

SEET A L=

i

Patataapatotd

O

i T=AY

s rtrmant

i

-
S

FatREakavi

ol Qoet

ancarcie

<
SR

e e Y

Leires
H

¥

oEny

Lok

ESES S e gt = v g

e 2

s en B
Fret

I
#

fimn alhall

(e e E g

]

P s¥s £y

st B 4

o

2037
T

prmyhv
SIRES

{

nia Harkhar

T

the

-

ho onnlinable t6 all srase A

inne nf thic car
FH-61

ha nrovie

=2

ty p vy

i

LT LA s oy e i

T R O T Tt

=

TTTCAT

[

T

Prey

T

£

ot
T

A3

RS =

T T

T

dhoreas and the ndenand

st

e re s eat
AIRELRREIRISATI N SAS A A= s

ith

mYakdly T

¥y

[rad
T

3re
TGS

ard bn

triot

15

CHOUTT Ot ST A Y

tometimn A
POttt
iotris

IE=a1a)

pal = el al
Y

Fal

o

{HTate
t

THTT

ITaatatat d

YT

Tl
T

cmntinn
SEEHGT

T

t

g=13

Ty

hal-be-centre

if ooy moet af thie

He-

toed
T

TYE

Sl Man

BRI IRA = E i~

AN AR

Summerland

FEn

int

i

to of Cars

TR RS

|
4

&
o

Vigions-

e

L

S

fri

g

~

rpart-the

WHR-aRY

in
H

o

T

nrovicinno

thetonding  omyy

AZE
PAHE

hlaf

o

D assiiirs
SR

¥

P rspations

the
Code

the eonntrong

[y

e

oy

i

=1

StorrohT gy T

g gy N

L

Qi 7 4

T

1393

T

oy

Rarihoro
Saboals

Sante
e EHHS

T

el

Cora _oned
G ege—Re—H

i

B ileling

CHTT o rre— 8

ada  Caolifnrnic
H A=

Eir
¥

TGOS

Califnrni




£1

Hions_onacifia

S Yoot opetioiiet

1

t

intsimod] in the Tt

Hb

\ oot 5
nstaled-and-m

TR RIS

r evustame chall ha

; !
Pevuratral
Py
e

£

automatie firo
SHHOMSHGHFE

3%

sasdnie

VY

meludead

TP

spotd athoarnades he

yvghiehs

v

nde

Euilndine

Cabifrre -

-t

ctefimeel

boX o

&m.w b & G Mﬁ ..mﬂJ 3 nMv .Wm) % IMW P ) %v 3 wm
. + e - £ 2
i % PEH82928 & 25 P
J . = I oa T Do . o 'y
2 gof Mﬂ T 2009=20 wm = % - S 3
il R %4 3 P | R 1S
%w 5 @ E ;% e B & e : 7 .m“ nu F ook
b [ % 5 P T fyrd & TR A v
1] g Do O oep & u * ~-
o] v P o ) B & 5 ¢ y &= B Do
: U2e gIaziniEr ¢ L1 E
el R = e 4 Of Do Lk ‘ - = &h
o B M 5 - — o % & ) $ =
.M w2 o GO +m i & G Qx m”
&b & ¢ : £ o W m = & . R &
2 S ) - g~
1 e 4 o) % L © o 2y h E ) b [4)]
. PE42EG IR0 R = 9 0 F s
I~ . 4. ¢ N b
L& P Q1 2 I AN
I o a1 .Jr\ J ) & q o
MW s b . P+ 4 mu rmm 1IN m = mt
. = o 3 , - - = mu .
- by 9 Ww g ww { , X :
. o Ay o L B
Ww ; : :H.. ES 2 % Mw 7 4 & Q2 Z + m L%
e lmd L S S 05 = Lo P O P2 % E ¢ ['n
b o B P : ; E s o B
) @ 9 . - b P 0. C w7
. e D= &= O
g o 2 £ ; ~ e uw.w £ 0. L, ¢ » [T & 7
) : 2B s A I :
:,h 29 S & ko 2 R mw % G P E mw{ &
3 =5 o [ i @ : T D o ¢
o 829 : g A A
urﬁ = & & I & Hﬁm N AN nv @ o B mw)
ﬂﬂw Mm & K & ! 182 & @ % 0 4
s EEx P s ) b Gk :
# e v - N iy a -
M“ & W g 2 [ F wm E | oo S P : S wE -
3 R 1 , “.%m,mwm@ : o = : ®89q =
L z8feFoeLgd 2 0% E =g @
5 0 = WJ L ] E Do @ LB =4 mw
[4+] m_ . £ ) ok op of B¢ - - ) JR A N
3 fozdfiesviale ¢ geve R T
BT P m._&:mw, P oEFS g 232774 2
BN IR RIIIE i1if
N W 3 RS O b1 ﬂv W - g C ok 2B wE L
A R @ R R R A S 1 A ] ke L& 4
s NN a2 D E @ 1 ® & mw : s oh &g f
oo ®E T & @ o 5 @ ¢ ww M i ol S I o
&Y % W E %J- B 4 B & ¢ . s T v
i T { £ . { | - . 2l &n ol & ~
g W D ey w G @ ¢ :nv i} .mm ) : ZE . T8 .
= T2 2T 500 e 88323 G % 2022 O
SR i LRI s RN EES RERE T 0] i3k
E.H.um i : 5 d aQ % i i QT &
5 8] s R3S R PY m £0=% > B
S . 3 & O . . . b y
% G @ - .% ¢ :‘m & % Mf iE m ) = & o) &
M &= M & 2 M 3 s FEDE W&FE &5 m i by & g
- R A g

st
ST
ne

[ an i

the-Fire-Chief
e

Sk
i

fa ITa¥al

~

¥

TG

e bl

o

y-the-Fre-Chief
ton

wding-Code—~may

=]

2
¥

Pigtdadime om thet §5 e

&
B-bonding-so-th
it

o

ik

PR

I

UG

ing-such-changecfuse-erecccupancy-in

Hhe-building-which-would-have-beenreguired-to-have-sprinklers_bui-for

hagilding

i

T
-

i

x> Cobifornis

SSisiR-v

be-Chapter1-Se

AL ATATIa=aua

Lo LS A=A~ X
[alsdei=ain Ay 2

oo

)

LYo T Tat NI ART Y

TG AT
=K

3.

=W al il aVlals STate iaFal Ve

T
HHE

o
151
Ny

L=
o

b

(A1 E=
7

o
ot in thic alibeactinn:

=

LERAT S
Aty e g
i

T

JEEE=a—2 e =a~ iy yis)

(a =t

7

42 4=

St
¥
et
.
4

et

chanae in-the ug

o-U-bulidings,-as
&l E—Ie £ty

Y
scept
lon-£

shnua otpd Aofiniiine
+

LERE=aa v
=
~

I

Hied-as-Greu
r-Secton-903

-

T

SfEfhic comtinn  mr piced the
e

tha aveantion. oo

E=g v gy v s g
O

o
[TE A~
=
I

FeS Ay

=

o 1o oy

om-S

o

famav;

+

b 3

T
vt
L Aoy
"
=
4
o
i
s Ep
ras v

+

e IRy

HREG
Wiihanouar gt

bé—e%ee :

L
N,

he aviciome
e-exisehce

ViTSTT

A=

lonoer rmant
ehg

the reauirament

=3
TR
e

T



i

AT ]

(A= A2

oo Ty

within the

WG

et I
S ST T TGy

(I A-R A NTe

A=27

e S b 4 25y M b o g - m - by e o b 5
Be TP D & i 2P D g e LG & 9 @ & g e
oL B d T @ o A - i g B g
i G = rill i e I - S i ki & 9
a Jow o & B W Y € R =g g i 15 o
SR N C s - L 4 €)] Wi [y S cap - Y sl ¢
5 2w H [ @ < s ) s S . h o - =k
! @ R A R RN o & o S LL O oo 3 wm 4 ) s Y
) G S T G € s o L& ) & : -
3 TR O O ¢ o & @8 m. @ ¢ B oW i P S @) o d
; S5 TL 9 od 2 B o= s = H o A I S A B 7
g B RROIN s @& G & =F @ DE o 2 8 & 2 s g
$ow G T o b N b 1o T T x @ i o] ]
- = ® L0 % o d o S, L oF wogn g \ @ o o= - bk ¢
@ ©TF b e @ o= S8 *E @ 9 D g8 ki g = - [, g
[ w W&ok o m S Y . o g7 R 1 i jau
Yo od @ & I 3 & A R B RE & 9
vy b AU R S - P ot i ek % It
sy SE oo 4 \ W € Th A @ A o :m.w : . o] ol IR
Loy w o 3 e o 4 = SR ne £ 9 i > o =
RN < T @ YE L a0 E @ b ) ]
o e i b et s b e TR A Y G | Rin A o o
B 2 y e o - & I O 9 G U o o m s 4
N ) £ B oy e . = =% A - g
S 39 = i R | am 2R m & g 2 R | & & y
5 R b i o & o O E ko I g 4 i d
A AR A ¥ a T T g b T R b B 1 4 2 ]
W SRR D e A S [T e - W Y 2 4
F Rl @ & & $ = 3 £ s & & e A S s & 5 g
o 2 Do S M oo g = 5 R jd e o
P T @ - @ F m @ ez Szl & 28 o i
o W e RS L 5 m D & sk w ST P s S W w & A e g
jN . AN L - N o T Sbe v {1 4 L )Y o1y bl
& ® S I S g Bl 2L8w K S @ o 4
= [N R A i Wk AL = o & 3 s I - hy = AR ; -
o S [ s J4 & o ¢ a bl @ % o R A b o & 4
R =R i saeg 9 WoRE @ F , = & p
= e S I R TR e o @ W M o - £ ]
& W B . cmm o o o w o & & ££ @ @ Ri O @2 @ Q9 @ [ 7
i R G O SO R Lo =D x SRV s e oA D 2 ey K ks -
oK B D © B a b & RS g L T i FIr 3 & o ¢
(IR s @ @b e REE S o J G w3 W e e L e [ s
. s S S =l 5 0E & o W @ ag g b b P a N
& D oE DL D o g s 2xE o A H LS oy G w o b g
> o A VAR = o = =08 7 L O oo [ o R I Y - A
= T Ee3 70 g = & gEq4 v P2EE 2T EL T EwW D z c F
T N BN s Wy 25g o S84 Eewg w7100 gd &
i) o T o AR s Qe fok Y o o n <h ) L E B o - - 5 Wit e agf
@ L 5 B o o o= 5 o & = -+ B4 ¢ @ 5 5 & [SUS =7 & o
i & = g oo ¢ = ] @i > e o % ¥ f e i S q > B e = : 5
wz O O & - o o P - 4L a4 wuld oD 2 & & =5 @ o oy il @ o s
¢ b o D ou @B W S0 =k & o+ g mn oW r noI R { oW (S .
4 5 O 1= b4 { 5 5ol il A @G P D E & Lho® R ¢
0 S < D %8} @ % 4w . - L (S ®» % . g 5 i .
D SER O g g @ 2 9 @0 T ? w9 Ll 2RPP & F G S g Qo g i o) &2 E
; th =k W f s i Y = h o a2 B e L oY ! 5 T ! rets :
@3 R & b 89 253 23 062378 24 %s08%% 8 24 e :
@ Eagp= g7 P . G =28 HE2 Fomy o gREPa L7 B of il
o A N R W99 br =84 o op g oW Py g 25 5 I
W SO g2 g o e WL Qg W B oLd4 P g g 5 % =298 4 Do oy o
R i moow o i) B W el = . 4 = a = o [ <
=) @ o o B ¥oE 4 e P w9 @ = / Y 2 DM oh T oA E D “f O 4 W )
N Bow w0 o @ Mool @ T e 0 R RS T R S & @ & -+ & g wp U o &
o by PRy = B o H 4l < # b £ ooh -0 Wy oy Y d hy D [ @l 4 a
o 2P E G @S o o T “ d £ b g & Wi woa P ® & @ x b ol TR -
2 R e wog Thy Ty e P oFLEd gt LE W ady &
T R G A R e 20 o R4 { b sl Reda @ 93 4 W W & £
3 CEBT LTI g g § Y29 Wy 907FFS4To00E33550 ww SED
W wll - o oYom P M 3 o T ch (3 Bz, I S N A A m‘m o W o & e
- e oo oo @ 5 O & 4 o D s34 S o i AT G ol e L W (=R S ot ¢ X
, L SR RGO L oo o @ T @ b AN .m =L Shoogp mu Q< T 5 .m. N B o
VT K vy S VR L A Y& L s i 2 Wy oo & o @ Tl i 2 X e ’ "
S E .wm mm & %w .mu ww @ B U_‘,m \WM Y M - mu £ Mu nw oo T Nu @ R mw w7 xmw Mw o e w iy
o Y p: i Lo y Bucka " 5 wnly - P s e DB R ¢ s s A P
R R A, I W& o . B SO e T S e b o A R«
p . B o p @ ¢ iR ) il o L @ L b oG b
REdEdLTES 8 g4 e N U d P oF ¢ Ly JW N
R @ @ o G & %' S 5 by Y -k £ e G )
i p Gk W o
I s [}
o Lt ol o
mﬁx A .M.nu MIJ

anta

oo

atV)
=~

s
i nf <
o4
Diigtriet
RG-SR

oo mr; e
SRR = S

S

St
oA
Yat sl

FF
retech

Drat

(T alTalalaldataliet 21

LED
Hia-

C

[SNA =gt i)

Ceiming
O

:
Fal
o

ihite
Darborg

1
EEi=ans

1E]
5
I

ey

Lo mreks
Fo—pt

S
=

=

=3

rice
fa¥m
Hyes

YV AT

b3 o Lor 1 o
e

.
£
~

Trans
Tt
o

f

¥
Lol af mEom S ma
THT

(. TR

mnearnnrat

=1

T

arnd ol
cHC—aH

ithir
HRH

FHFEATE TG
(aTal¥]
Y

STy

¥

S
Baorhars Ay imty
i

CATTACET O
groey

st
Homellime of
e e
aoreementiss




® ©
le =4
& 7
T
D0
b @
]
& &
@ b
1IN
b
uh o
£ 9
W w
@4
ok Ol
B
& iF
84}

W

4

T

of Eir

N
\Y.,.W..
BT
&

o @
oo
Y
o om
N
o
w .
@ @
® 0
& @
&
& 4
&
w ,on..
C W
@ W
o
b
o
gu, |
ul £
T
P ..m
g ar

¢

T

£

T

4

o haedar 8

anf Saooulatinn

oy e

o bt

@]

vagiths Title

VY TLT

dea ahall ~emndy

T e

dienlave af firowveem

ot OO T et e — 8

+

T

TS

SHTETY

TRV

SHhapery

=57

amondad by
Fepy—afReRaes

harahy

it

i
2

i

L]
34060
eSS

MBUSTIREE -

co

; 'E'Q‘——tﬁ

LAMMABL

ina-the limite refarred to in Soctic

b

G- CHAR

Pevnnse -

ko

TR TR YT

A4 as

EaYaral

A2 G
bt

A0
e

e 3
GRE—S

LI I e gy vy iy o LA~ ) o a g e

FHAG-EA

tabhlial

WEES T

L8
=y

18]

i

CTIORN 2406

SE

in Seclions—-3404

rafarrad tn

limmite
et

The

Ty

district-and

ot the CEC are haorahy

¥

s

24062 4.4

o

[t ata

T

2.0 5 1
S St evaTS oo

t

T

T

s

T

33

o
U

RN
ot

ZF

o
G

i

inaffer-namead

T LS i e

i

!

nd-the-particularzone

ohicf:

Falde

-five-acres-or-

™~

o

¥

Craner
=

ned-by

o~ L it
not-less-than-fiy
de
el
ot}

T

:
T

+

s
k3

o

<x

b @W‘ i 2

tial ~
Hat
¢
¥
Py

administrator-under

=1

T

! Al

est
S5t

- v b
mersial-o
he-chiefis-ok

é‘?’) llq & < 0 i - o
ey Where-th : si
(b} \Where-the-writen-appron

ohi e ¥

=y

=

:

"

YBREs-here

e

L

section-3804 2 asfollows:

=

H

£y
lmits

o-thedimits of alf

.

ablished

2 Dy agreen -
e i .

d-zones-as-folows:

a e

=heraby
on district

i
F DT

Fa fﬂrv \, ept tha& o4 eh St@rag%s Eir
zoning-and-otherordinan and-lawsi-the

2d-subjecth
wb]
3

ag
Ly
TR

.
e

2 zones:

(21 AGE

i

Zohe

uti-rrot

=

£

OFe-

FaX datal
(=g

is-five

[,
Ca=

$

¥

8

e—th‘

£

Lo

o

3

ghreas
3 In

neer

i
T

PoYa

I

e~

re-by-th

EHE

222

Ead

perbe-as-determined by-the chi

.y
T
=

-
a3

se-aste

o
o

Fee

£y
IS

r‘

alorsimile

[dal

frofor omel thhe
TSt T e e

o Fanino oacrmin
S-ZGRHRG—aaRHRE

ooty
-t

et

other roccnnahla ~anditisne
a2 s Saas 1S HZ { :

T

T

=i

(o) Siihiant tn ciinh

[QiEr= e e s u e g p ey

4

EREACE FIRE AREAS-is

YR

5 =y

23

[+

s
i




(A2 =4

i

a4 O W @ @ W o Yo o s GOEE O O o g oo ]
ook oo A ooh & & R O - oo Do oW o G N an
D e T GeE LR G o 58 s 29878 PE D &0 < s
i) oL 3 T S L e b DI s Lo o pres 4 Pt s
@ R R I & & LFad S og oo Qo d W gy =
! 20 AR I i o d iR Y] G Qg & h ol 2 P
@ & N - P H = & oo & LA S - 4 el Ruiges A
i RS @@ Y n g @ ER I I @ @ p B
n N Eof 8 i Hoap & § Ly T W o B ok T
Lo I mw ) i A N a IR 4 I - i g 3B L
o @ £ @ i QP a @ &L &£ 0 P WEHF @G W T s i
4 o & DO S A 3 EE U W oo oT L& Q- A N )
& @ o8 G 5 @00 H T [V AT a o P R LS B ) o W
A g o @ O 2 Ee L = ol = i WL b g & F
& e iR A o D@ I 2 ) @ XD oo & o e
® & = & e P 8 gt A N MG R i 502 am
ZEd 14 o O BT G @ E O d T BIHsL9 AR R T - S 0
. L AL G D g - W < & 5 D o4 O WO o
) - S & T = E o 4 W ® g E oo W 3 W =
e i) SRV S = ¥ 5 we Qg G L PO LEIFE & Y s
2oF WL oW &0 25T E £ 5 @ d dy ¢ 2 TR T RS ) W up T
£ A £ LW @ ¢ QLo om o & D & @ © W kL
20 D P SLP a2 D = [ € & & BT o GoLY  F o g
i A 3 E=n R 5 g - < uk A i
T £ O 2E LET G T ongg ETR 2970 Gdg 3 o
P &b W o W L R o > & & - 0o E L9 bk
&= a2 i B o o Mo o 1L b e o e O o AN s D W %
S ek 22E LG 8 FIeg  $20G TETg f43 4@
il o o e s n - s i 2 oeR L . R ot I
4 TEEd zeyecT 2 GO vy IR =T 92g Tag o
= SR o H e F P 0] @9 & % Lop o BH oA =+ P
. = $ L 1t oo ¢ 2, o 2 7 i 4 E H oo Wl
& 5 5o Qe & T & chod 3 e DA @ oo & oo B
; Bom L - K N i Do R LLoap £
b d W Lk N TH 9D P s i B.Qg % ¢ @ - d
an P 18 R £ 9y 4% W EES G Gw @ &
e - S ] ¢ i i @ A Ik mw o T o5 9 i
= S . T et i = i 9 ¢ b i : -
i T 2 & T @19 = y &8 e g 0 &
& e pa - ) e R e L . &
=) .o ] ¢ e S e A T N %
D 5o & & wk s 4w . . W 9o o G "
, e N e =5 B - I A s SR - R B 5
@ ook & T al’ s ,vmm @ @ w4 5 ‘,L A A o M”w. L ¢ o
& o2 TR v B A T =1 ok Do - & T
OR I A AR o : 5 ) oo n, ,,{m‘ web (D & = gy @ on 3
b [ R o S ¢ B e B = T ooy ek 4 A wdoo (L0 e
T o oD b A VI S s B @ e e o D - b G oo - - -
e TR O N & oue o dnow @ i o D LoE oy o & wor " =
oy &= o ¢ ORI § o L S A e - we SR O - Y@ -
g QL p P [ I ol S [ h W= o oata o g oo P ow L @ B O
el T D H o % JUY [T . : M s [N &y 7 . o O W o L &
e m.mm LF o8 »PETPE -2 d @ sw IS L9 Wgder HEE s
i - A o I & O o2 @l R T I L P & =
r @@L B F UL o 8o gy e B Pdsa= G500 & g &5 P
SN P E F P DT L o L& s o ok S & O 3 i a3 r D Qo &
n e f U = b T D W Q 2 ¢ m S E G e @ O oW e ¢ o
@ i ¢ @ & o] 8 o5 S . LW b =k o o o S ) = & T o @9 Y g
2= @ D E FTE2YPL gPe MPoBO P ]gd R T D b % g
s = & MW &5 b oDy ET & . ; TH4a gmoPof wa e g £ .;mu & ¢
B R N~ S 5 ] o . A A ) b . @ -k d
Lup btk %m 5 WEO e @ Y v Il ()] § &2 o - (] £ & - d B
s 0 TR e e 7 W @ aoo o B FTRF e wGH e B ag B o9 & o
eI s W P T mn o kg se P ST S EDTdz HBELPFF Ll o o
g o dEes ]SS0 62H URLEe SHILoE EZPT gas &
ol astn o ! L hoouf w P a8 u - LJPD- 4) 4] - - . 0
s &2 g = ¢ * b LY SR~ A A R i T - &
— ey WD &L 5% ¢ g s ME EPs J9dTTE ad?g oL &b =
e I o < W S : O Ws s e Bl edeE 9 &g e
(e mmm v,m“ﬂ. Wb © FA D R S S | ¢ Ol .(mm o8 LLYE PEeaw . TE
R Mo oW o 9S g0 o a7 [ U= S A O O o wo 9w L
0 € oy ok Mt o ] g .mM,» T T alh 29 ¢ b el @ o WP T (O R THe T
o ¢ Qw 52w R T S R the o R P T oo @ G N
! b Q 3 d] & heEd o d o & & o W e g B B ¥ oW w ol B3 g
P

loanda
T
ot all
T
mado by
dao nf tho
S

TTTCE

syl
i

by
e

coviaran
Xy
Lt
sriend
e

G
bye
Hreoresd

Baeh

e

£

t

ton oanh o

Ivreigol
St
fae

S

imnco
R
t
3

iy

[
ST TR TS
T

V
ar cirnichiirs

thcombuctibla ot
&

\RIL

ERaaent
t

toovaran
ot
t

T

not loce than 290

|FaiTata)

i

T

toneo At

<t

kTatd=tel
et

z

T

a
the-bu

AN YW PN Ve
oo O EHeE

tn
T
"
i

t

hat
ionand

trreet
T
o 4

ouniainous-are

lnm

o
et
for

¥
=

Fata MiaYal

T
SOt

S i 1 a 1Y

A™as
(TaVallal¥¥islyl

3
Areyeimed
Eah

Iande

3
d plaar

=
1

VO
AT

1
VT

Miaints
AhaH Y

1

/

jatanTatiilalaiielel

{2}
TGS

grase.covarao

i
grass



Lafamtmialny
ST

t

e
T

ybrininos o
HHGHE S

firves
HHES

Ly

PEo]

tho  mranariys
B

¥
t

FaYs

RArLi At Es A
SHHCTIHE—GF

S

vegetation-

I3

hpatlding _ne
BHHGHAG

-

p=rp sl

sazdby _fbied

Zone

Euel

@
152

Raci

R i v o a e Y

ey badilelime ne obriiehire. o
SHHICHRG—OF

kd
Tt

T

FCE

=

adiagent o

Eatotal

s bt ot

B Maintain-ocround

=T

ar _combactibla o~

veanototinn

hia

flovmne

r

g

s
=)

e

BT

FeaTatVitalatitat]]

OO T

mada
e

}

H-HeH
Cormen mirel

vt

S TR tHa T

et

e
<

HCH TS

ot
hel

g

o

oparbe lin

TR

S AR =

T

ey oy
T

T

Pl Vol Tl
= *

oy ety e
S oTeh

oF

rouys thea b sileling

LA M

Fract
ar

T

Y
T

s
%

gt 14

[AA - Saua~ pens s a ey

Fatubet Ju)

ire-anddess-than

4

o

=as)

et X}
=3 v

4
T

sary-

ize

o

=1

7

=

941 —and

P

dead-vegetative
42

cHon-

oy
~
=&

=

o free
\ ]
roes

g

oy

ali

2

23

\

of

ELR IR N pea =g {

[

e
TR

ultriral e

Crcia Tt

Ny fn o

PETY

Coction A744 4 doas net
o4~ +4-4-00es

Y

qinede crmemimme e
HHG PG

TGt

ma~ay

on-the-owner-or-possesserof

2y

47

-+

3

=1

Hdirect

<

SF-W

=t

te-Barbara-County

L]

o

ten—day

refuses-to-abatesaid-fire

Coda-Chantar 45

O

.

&
=

s

He or
fror ol
er-being

3

T

‘ﬁ P !

Cuidance that tha currani

r

T

on-as-gdescH

=t

nira

0

oindy

~

assaessment-roll of the

rticia Vi

A

ey

wr

T

LN e 1}

1

133

TR

TV TO RS

VT

Hoo-Article—\
erty-assessed-to-a-pe

T ets

Y

A=

ChroRrOtT

(S EA=aem ey )

show

P

e

op

~such-property-

-

perof

<=

.n..l
&

4

sessment

b additic

T

H

E-5O

Tl

setd

f _tL

cel-Rumbet

inthelast-gssesespe-of the nroneriy ot the sdedrece Slusn an onedy enll

E:

q
L

the
e

bl
T

et e i e R h ) it

Yot T O G T oo gt e e

LA T S ) = i

A2 Lo top s v Siesw vt giog oo

b
b

ST O

T

<

TS

LAR N

ime-andlocationofwhen-the Boord-of Superndsorsof

PRELLIN R A= = 4 i

the enmsifin dote
HE-SPpRGHC-Gat

HFy e
153

St
tha Coumty of ©

arcer shall srendd

Az

ARl B s

S

e

T

3

e ranart of the fire ohief rocgardina the
eatRe-reped

13

clude-the following:

-] ' %
Sante-Barbara-willmeetto-hearth

st

SoTroy

e

B

-

-

¥

t

P

dst

>

[

BN

: iy it rectihe-F et or b ;

iy

i

~i-at-such-hearng ¢

v

=3

QSSSSE! ) A{:;{b”l

1<

"



R

S

lmeial oo mrie

. it
TaTatRdars
TRy

4

ot e

TG

PPt Tt
RS

of tha
-t

oy

~F 3
f"ﬂ:}, '!T'K.r
poane St

iy

i
e ey

il

T atadaltals
(RS

o th
e

it

shall

i+
t

pa

f\rw;z“(\rc"

A=A

oLy

(oY atetele WY
e S L

e eyl
e

[ER iy

oF

£
CESIT STy
ST

raf
e

£S5

ks
T

IRANARL

fayata

s

Py
T

TR

TS
¥

tho metine
S

=1

§

PTAS ZMINNG PR WA T

Fa¥atihd
o ety
HoH

3

Fa¥a G Zut oV Y Ttoro

1
g RS

SEHRERY
racmivimel

T

assaessment-roll i

VALCLE,
VY

&

it abad] mbes

by

Tyt

£y

crirrang
SoelH

o
L

g

i
Pl mevtiee
P F O

nronashy

h

+

o

st Bl

4

i

TRy

il

ey roomemnail
=

LR VA I 1 ey S

fatote

Tt

mAYATok o)

e

et
$har

ol

e

thy

Ay i
SHER
[ mteTal

Tha
e
Ly e
T
Fa¥s
e
¥ied

chviad

e Ye INatal Bin!

Ty

.

o o e
=

Puerhaamy

t

narsat
e

£
yor

=

2%

=y

CHIEY

£ am

}
i

cmcarobhim
o

g
SEE2EE0R

CHGTEWY

clawdul naseneonr

i Y]
TS
mveetroal
S
iy
H-B

(i

[N

i

+
F

iy frant

Py
p]
T
=23
T

|

(S

T

e
LW atats y([E«'\'\n
<ot

it

e

i o

=

by

L3 g

VT

I3

ract oo otroed
2ot

=2
Fire
.
ey meyetbe
et
nat
e
N
e
tho owner
b

+

T
T

oy ol
=

dome

s e ey
veTTth
o)

E

i
2

A b o b o F

Pt

'

noreal

[SA= =t

i
}

Py

R ped i}

H_oiieh

T

Aoy
[HaWa1iyr=

B4
T

nr

i

feve

2
P

ey e
o

r

o
T

Vi

S
IR e =aieav

T

L3

=Tyt

b

days

by

t

et

oy

Iy o5l

(=i aaiey

¥

e

vo hefors
7 >4

¥

;
;
i

R ‘u b T

i

Trrect

5 el

v appribte e
T

iy

Hnna

$hm

Loy

h=

crryiyhyy
SHPPY

f des F

T

s

TTCEE

i
(53

RS

abimetiore

RIS Tt
S g
THTY

pybem o
h

L
vt

el
(R R

TTTEST

T

fires 5y
s

gad-H

1

TR

b Vet

ool
TRt

i
:

]

'3

attand . in

ey fl

IRt il

th

o

el

Ratr oty
it ;

ped

PR = ]

o

Ty

E=a 3

7

[RERE

(SRS

represens

PR TaTy
¥

et

[aYe M)

T

Py e

narcal comevs bbby B

i

oy
e

T

o .

s }-\mf‘ Ty,
tHHE-a5

a4
e

e o b

fnal
7

1

oyt

TG

s crme e
fre

o
[TaTHT

[t =gy

[
oL
ont

=

TEPTES
s
13§

e Mz atoly]
e

T

.

ava

oY

+Ot
nf thic artiels The

LS an~s)

ey
SHePRSE

=

R

L Earws
TROTUT

o
&

vkt
Giakish
trHer—

T

ot
Stek

Pyrenie ey pr e

= = )

AT
=

1=

ha

123

PR
Ty
A=

Ty

anoarcing

EnT X admtad
DY GTr
TR

&

]

Arimes
G

i
t

Il
=
i
+

£

cp g awy]

oy

e

B et o "
Breafipn Figres  fo ooy e peed
I EI LRI a2

T o a A T s L PR, ey
f HAE e R—L

g

b

Biruey

T

i
an

P

Ty

ey oot $
to—=oate-n

i

tha ch

THS

4
ot

i

CRtreae

irrong
T ety

naoroal
A

=3

N aYatal
=i=A=1a)

lre haoward aviet
Ao G XSS

£

ed

(3ma=ae
E= R e g

fimeie
TGS

TG

heymrdd
2

ioiey

TR

AR

p=]

hoardno and ¢
o -+

|Pntatal

R

it

Tava ot A=A R Vol o)
S-S
=

to mroveoesed
procaesadt

1
3%

£
+

dn

t

g

racirtbaiey o oo

T

THICCATET

the

1A b

ahzil

R=1}

by

T

=

et

e

i

3
a
4

i

e
TR

[ St
oo

£ ook o
SHGEH—&

o

EiTata)
Ho R

FataValatalat
=)

toyy ol

-
Tt

£

e
FErEH

~f bl
L~

faTatul

e v
(s S A

royazith

T

th

2 avd
e

chinf
tHET

TETTEe
Ra¥e
H

T

iement

=
arith
Vi

TR T

=3 n

¥

G

SoUn ciek
:\!“Fio»"nnrﬂ* et eeveag

©

3k

T

L nrmeand §
=

&
&
i
H
crivy
<Y

i

i ened

T

EnTakadmtalagmtol

s =

T

A
T P AT

k
i

3
LEa T i Nl
<

Tepiio

L ala
boy

lmet lemeware

LR an e s s

TOET
[geisaty

R
LA o iy > o

(2stend
1S
= e

iaiga=ny

[

7

t

&

Fire
i

oo
R OHAER
oot -
cHoetE-o
hedfora b
e

(A
RRY=4]

G
GG v ele s
f

mnyronrintecl

¥

and addrace o
oarmniotalys

(R}

T
TR
ET =
atelPu¥al
cHoTe s

bves myoreeen

HE
oS ot ot W &
BT

TEer by

ST

£
k=

oiemifembnie
et

it

ar
=

T

T

LS V=Y sttt )

orsmbrey
¥ oot

TTT

U T =

TETTT

72

I SR Tl o}
SHGT

o

frimde
e Hah

faYetutalisatetadats)

i

T

'
=1

T aYmtal
=4

£

fnatmit]
T

=Yotal

=

Aot the
v

o feoay

SereS

ﬁ!}l
seos

Stk
e Yasy]
ot
oy

T

el

7

TS

ahiaf ol

he

k

Ao

]

P

g

shzil

[Nl ST al
=)

=R =g

[t s atnd

g

[ aYatatd
ST
Tl
iiaia:
tRs

hazarg

el sppbniods

L =4

+
[tk
<

fevet v

b oyt
R
i
i
firs
HiE
¥

o
s

£

Enr)

&
PN m I ol B Yl

E g p v

hrj

&

b
(285

T

oY avetlatal
et

VY
Ly
ks

¥
=

iy

HER

¥

[anie

=
i
e

vf thve sared

sashor

TR

HAS
=
H]nrr\r\

F
T

vesareos . Rarerrt So S

-

A

Pk
iy =g

FaARalatatnfotsl

b

TR

o EEnE s
T
o

S LI

=
i

b
HHE

s
2
25 e

v
Voo

P S 31

=

J

T

vl

1
N
D
D
{

1

hey

(oA v 3y

[T aYalal

ALl D Y]
£

Ly

fwksd

AL odmaym

tha ~ouinhys

+

soenrchine

i e

FTOEETR

fatatitatey]

LelilnTatal

H
=f

5t

H

S
i

T

i
Sy pnd
=HC

thye

TERTT
Fa a3

T
=

1SN

R

PR

ot
IR

CHRATEIEy

fhhe
tH

fmta Tl
it

FOH-G
tobrebing

SEbrHEHT
thyes  mooseoeves
teHE—
el
2 oY

Ay
rasenmable
GRS

¥

=
oyzailabe
e

(v

-V a¥~Yul

TR

EE S
~ L
ia¥ul
T
RO

SITHEE T

topl
Hstes

T
Yalad

&
roameart ololl feed el
FEREH

AEerat1as:
Spimky
SHGH

Iy oy

T
T

Vi

A=

[epvaea
LT nd Al et o ol
T ¥

L

(ZR=1

ot

e
wisich ayeh
known

e

£

T

ik

cardl o sSevnd

e

i

e
SRS

A-tire-ie

1

iomee freoann
=2 H

i nf coiman
-0

| T aTrTaln:

bt the b

=

fiveenrd

)

e f
A

kel
e

reatis moveto oy
OO

£
e

[

A A=

itk racolatione
£ =

AT

T

1

CEET

T

rommet nf
R saias

2P
e

-

T

o

FETEE

TS

Coynfirrm st

ey

R e

by o bo ol

Y

Pl vt
e

f= B
i

e

hem L
Ty

jad
iry
H

soeton
FrYTEY

v
£

£REEIY Y
St

B

p=]

bt

to-—oublic
tHI—REHHHG

Fatatatn
T

TS

Fili

Fatal
S

¢

Sintoinesd
FHEHR RS

Ihe oy £
=

choll
Sticht

cmrtion A7
HER

=3

T
tioh

comforroel
Hy e T

[2LdaYatalnd ot
ey =

fihe

Hiala il

2 hoori
g

Iy
4

TR

=l LA VTSN,

Ty ot
it

»

T Tt g

of the heoed
[hasat

t

ot C?nr!

y
&

-

Fipm f
g ¥

o nf
SH

T

i
T

e mactiom

He:

SRS

GeyoHHe

Hosorinly

SHCH

'Ff'\f‘ r-l\Ph

t SHER

S—Y-the
at

IR EL= 28]

ARG
3528
It s
SHah
fllad by the
olifim
CHHG

T

firemnel
Satas

:
[a nd
o)

3

I

[aal

<3
nonacaa f

TRy

ARRs=3

T
$i

%

af ciimb ton daye file

-2HF

(=1
T

P
th o
tHE
£
3

e o

Y
T
HER
¢
e

T
3

T
¥

EAMENETT
F

ey A
Hnelatal

nnﬁrv‘nﬂﬁr\ﬁ

S

e
bhoard mov sk

e
tho ranert o
e

T

s

A
roccnisat
ASES

t6

T
L=

a3

hofars Hy

=]

I
i

=i
1
yrithern
F
ad]
oG
b the romort ool b

Srbexy
Abhiontinne

P
such
)

T
¥

=Taty)
Y
Ar cuch hearing thi

=252l
tha haoarins tinmn sk
SR
Poratve
<HY
v

T
1y
it

any narosn oh
TS

3
t

tn hoo

A

t

PE
H-any
the

&

i

.
a.of
&
e
Feet
ceotion
St

SASea
crpmnlio

TR T

ool

i

{
i

¥
THART
TG

g g th

=g e

¥
T

Py

S AN

fdaosme el

¥
t

3=
L{ur_\rl’ for mat
$hve

meteleme o
<

S
s
hoorg

it iRt am]

1

nfirem ariab reneet

tha

STty
i

o

3
e

T
5
e

7.

0

i
t

ol

aspmitton ro
HEeSHRG;
chinf =c

haorire
G

hoar
2
S-AHHE
L
Retee

TR

ornfi
GO

T

T+ =
T (=a=s]

¥ad

BT

frar
et

i

FEEOTTE

1
P

t

T

the amount

TR

10



474405 Erxpenses-constitute speclhalassessment-and Hen—The-ameuntolexpenses
Hﬁ@uqtped—%y_%he—ebief-fe#ahahrg—aﬁwe%ﬂ azard-when-cenhfir “q&@iex}mr% re-baard-upder-the
%MM&&%MMH&W&@-&—Z% ial-assess %sz—éﬂa'm parcel-from
which-sush-ha reofiorthe o qvan&v—% shuch-assessment:

-auditor-gontrollerThe board shall deliver

MW%W%M%M%@%W
befars-Sugush-d-fellowing h-confirmation:

4744 inslusiol aessment-o ;—:pﬁw%a il Sisrosition-of-revehus—The
county—auditorcontroller shall _antar _tha stz i the  ronact 5 a-soecial

ty—akditercoptroller—shall-enter—the p a6 peckal
a%n%smeﬂpagm%%g@ﬁem%e%ﬁb@é4@%wregeﬁﬁa%eeeu@e%&@—m@%ﬁ%

shal-include-the-amount-of the-assessment-en-the-billfor-taxes %é%«%&i—?h%«@ﬁé}%
A«H—W@pf;heﬂbi@e%heﬂl&w—eaneeyen and-enforcement oo 4 licabletis
: ssessments—coll wé—az—ﬁqtewmm#—aﬁ—ele
Jhan—beugaedﬂm{e%h&geﬂe}:al iw:\é—ei—the—@eup By-TFEasLry:

H-ARRENDECCHARTER-1+—ADMINISTRATION is hereby revised and amended as follows:

SECTION 101 GENERAL
Section 101.1 Title is amended to read as follows:
These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of Santa Barbara County, hereinafter
referred to as “this code-"".

SECTION 102 APPLICABILITY _
Section 102.1 Construction and design provisions is amended by adding the following:

Exception: This section shall not apply to any agricuitural buildings, specifically
exempted in Santa Barbara County Code Chapter 10, Building Regulations, which
reads as follows:

Agricultural buildings not exceeding 3,000 square feet in floor area constructed and
used to house farm implements, equipment, hay, grain, poultry, livestock or horticultural
products. Such buildings shall not be a place of human habitation nor a place of
employment, nor shall such buildings be used by the public, be used to store
hazardous materials in violation of the Fire Code, nor contain plumbing, mechanical,
electrical, structural or architectural features that may reclassify the occupancy or the
character of the occupancy of said building as determined by the Building Official. See
Section 10-3.3 of the Santa Barbara County Code.

And provided that, whenever there is any change in the use or occupancy of such building
so that it no longer meets the above-listed specification for exemption of agricultural
buildings, the building must comply with the requirements of this code prior o making such
change of use or occupancy.

SECTION 104 GENERAL AUTHORITY AND RESRCEIBILITIEGRESPONSIBILITIES
Section 104.6 Official Records is amended to read as follows:
The fire code official shall retain official records for not less than threefive years unless
otherwise provided by other regulations.

Section 104.6 is further amended by deleting Sections 104.6.1 through 104.6.4.

SECTION 105 PERMITS
Secticn 105.1.1 is amended by deleting the phrasz " . if any,...” in the second sentence.

11



24 108 BOARD OF APPEALS is amended by deleting the entire section. Board of
Appeals is covered under Santa Barbara County Fire Code, Astisiet

Appendix A

SECTION 109 -VIOLATIONS is amended as follows:
Section 109.3 Violation Penalties is hereby amended by deleting the existing language
and inserting the following: -Violation penalties are covered under Santa Barbara County
Code, Chapter 15, Article V1.

Section 109.3.1 Abatement of violation shall remain unchanged.

SECTION 111 STOP WORK ORDERS is amended as follows:
Section 111.4 Failure to Comply is amended to read as follows:
Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work order,
except such work as that person is directed by the Fire Chief to perform to remove a
violation or unsafe condition, is guilty of an infraction and-liabisas described in Santa
Barbara County Code, Chapter 15, Article V1

ik} CHAFPTER 2 - DEFINITIONS is amended as follows:

SECTION 202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS is amended by adding the following terms:
FEF%E‘ HAZARD. Any thing or act thal increases or could cause an increase of the hazard
or_menace of fire to a finegreater degree than that customarily recognized as normal by
persons in the public service reqularly engaged in preventing, suppressing or extinguishing
fire or any thing or act that could obstruct, delay, hinder or interfere with the operations of
$the fire department or the egress of occupanis in the event of fire. When a Fire Hazard
has been determined to exist by the Fire Chief. the Fire Hazard shall be considered o be 5
nuisance.
HRE PROTECTION CERTIFICATE (FPC) Is the application for review of any new building
r structure that requires s building permit, any residential building or structure that adds an
accumdiatlon of 1000 square feet or more, any commercial building or structure that adds
an accurmiilation of 500 persquare feet or more, any commercial building or structure that
adds any square fcotage exceeding 5000 square fest, or the review of any changes to a
fire protection system.
FETROLEUM FACILITIES. Shall, for the purpose of this code, be designated by the Fire
Chief_and include, but not be limited o, tanks, compressors, pumps. vessels. and other
large equipment or structures pertinent o oil field eperations sited at a sinale location,

{c} CHAPTER 3 ~ GENERAL PRECAUTIONS
SECTION 304 - COMBUSTIBLE WASTE ER
304.1.1 Waste material, is amended by inseriing the phrase “When determined o be a f
hazard " at the beginning of the first sentence
304.1.2 x!@@eaatgm is amended as follt
By inserting the phrase "When delermined to be s fire hazard,...” at the bedinning of the
first sentence.

By replacing the words ", the lnlernational Wildland-initerface Code” with

4914 of this code”.

IST FIRE is amended as follows:

.. Section

{d} CHAPTER 4 - EMERGENCY PLANNING AND PREPAREDNMESS is amended by deleting all
sections except the following:

SECTION 401 GENERAL

SECTION 402 DEFINITIONS

SECTION 403 PUBLIC ASSEMBLAGES AND EVERNTS
SECTION 407 HAZARD COMMUNICATION

12



e} CHAPTER § - FIRE SERVICE FEATURES is adopted in its entirely with the following
amendments:

SECTION 501 GEMNERAL
501.1 Scope is amended by adding at the end of the sentence *.._and Santa Barbara
County Fire Department Development Standards”.

SECTION 503 FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS
803.1 Where required. is amended by adding at the end of the sentence . and Sania
Barbara County Fire Depariment Development Standards.”
503.2 Specifications. is amended by adding at the end of the sentence ' .and Santa
Barbara County Fire Department Development Standards.”
503.2.1 Dimensions. is amended by replacing the phrase “.. of not less than 20 feet
(6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in accordance with
Section 503.6,..." with the phrase " .in accordance with Santa Barbara Couniv Fie
Department Development Standards...”
503.6 Security gates. is amended by deleting the existing language and replacing it wiih,
‘The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus access road shall be in
accordance with Santa Barbara County Fire Department Development Standards.”
505.1 Address numbers. js amended by deleting the words., “Numbers shall be 2
minimum of 4 inches {(161.6 mm) high with a minimum stroke of 0.5 inch (12.7 mm).” and
inserting the words, "Residential building numbers shall be a minimum of 3 inches {(76.5
mm) high with a minimum stroke of 0.5 inch (12.7) and Commercial building numbers shall
be a minimum of 6 inches (153.0 mm) high with a minimum stroke of 1 inch (25.4 mm)”.
505.1.2 Mixed-use Building. is added to read as follows; A notification system shall be
installed in a manner and location approved by the Fire Chief, which indicates the presence
of residential dwelling units.
505.3 Road Naming, is added to read as follows: all public and private access roads shall
be named in accordance with the Santa Barbara County Fire Department Development
Standards and the County Land Use and Development Code as adopted under Chapter 35
of the Santa Barbara County Code.

SECTION 507 FIRE PROTECTION WATER SUPPLIES
507.1 Reguired water supply. is amended by adding the following sentence to the end of
the paragraph, "Fire protection water supply systems shall be instalied and mainiained in
accordance with Santa Barbara County Fire Department Development Standards.”

{f} CHAPTER 6 BUILDING SERVICES AND SYSTEMS is amended as follows:

SECTION 610 is added to read as follows:
610 Photovoltaic Systems
810.1 General. The installation of photoveltaic systems shall comply with this section
and the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code and the requirements of
the local authority having jurisdiction.

Exception: Section 610 (et seq} shall not apply to photovoltaic systems installed on one
and two family dwellings.

6162, Plans. Construction plans that include a roof layout of the proposed photovoliaic
system panels and equipment shall be submitted to the fire code official for approval prior
to installation.

§10.3 Design. Photovoltaic systems shall be designed in accordance with the “SOLAR
PHOTOVOLTAIC INSTALLATION GUIDELINE” issued by the Californiz State Fire
Marshal Office April 22, 2008 with amendment to Section 2.2.1 (page 10) as follows:

13



Section 2.2.1 on Po 10 of the SFM “SOLAR BHOTOVO
GUIDELINE” is amended to read:

Aocess

E !y“w
‘\,
a:»

;“ha» shiall be a minimum six-foot (8) wide clear perimete
edges of the roof, as measured from the exterior bearing walls or’ ihe
building to the nearest photovoliaic panel. E)ga”mlm #5 {0 #8 shall reflect
this requirement.

Excention: if either horizontal axis of the building is 250 feet or less.
there should be a minimum four feet (4)) wide %e Der!meter around the
edges of the roof, as measured from the exterior | the
building to the nearest photovoltaic panel.

(g} CHAPTER ¢ FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS is amended as follows:

IR
SECTICN 801 GENERAL is amended as follows:
SECTION 901.4.1 Reouired fire protection systems is amended by adding at the end of
the senience ... and Santa Barbara County Fire Department Developmeni Standards”.
SECTION 01 @ En@g&emmm testing and maintenance is amended by adding at the and of
the last sentence " after obtaining written permission from the fire code afficial

SECTION 802 ~ DEFINITIONS is amended by adding the following terms:
[B] AWKING, An architectural projection that provides weather protection. identity or
decoration and is wheolly supported by the building to which it is atiached. An awning is
comprised of a lightweight, rigid skeleton structure over which a covering is attached.
[B] COURT. An open. uncovered space, unobstructed to the sky. bounded on three or
more sides by exterior building walls or other enclosing devices.

SECTION 203 AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS is amended hy revising section
903.1,903.2, and by adding a new section 803.7:
803.1 General. is amended by adding the following phrase to the end of the sentence:
"...and Santa Barbara County Fire Depariment Development Standards.”
993.2 Where Reguired. is amended by adding at the end of the sentence...”and Section
Q03,77
903.7 Saniﬁa Barbara County Automatic Sprinkler Svsiems.
The provisions of this section shall be applicable to all areas within the Santa Barbara
County Fire Protection District and all other unincorporated areas of the County. except the
areas within the Carpenteria/Summerland Fire Protection District, Montecito Fire Protection
District, Vandenberg Air Force Base, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Lands. unless otherwise
specified by this Chapter. if any part of thig article is in conflict with anv other parl. the more
restrictive provisions shall be controlling.
803.7.1 Locations Required. Concurrent with provisions in the California Eire Code.
California Building Code, California Residential Code, and in the Santa Barbara County
Code, automatic fire sprinkier systems shail be installed and maintained in the locations
specified as follows:
1.AH new one and two-family dwellings and fownhouses {R-3 Uccupancies ¥,
{2010 Californiz Residential Code, Chapter 3, Section F-313 Automatic Fire
Sprinkler Systems / 2018 Californiz Building Code Chapter 2, Section 203.2.8
Groun B}
2.Mew buildings and structures with a final floor area of 5,000 sauare feet or
more.
New buildings or new structures (including prefabricated or relocated structures) for
which application for building permits are officially filed or required to be filed with the
Santa Barbara County Planning and Development Department. Building and Safety
Division, which have 2 total floor area of five thousand square feet or more: and
3.Hew buildings and structures located outside the Urban Limii Line.

14



New buildings or new siructures (including prefabricated or relocated structures) for
which application for building permits are officially filed or required to be filed with the
Santa Barbara County Planning and Development Department, Building and Safety
Division, that are constructed (regardless of sguare footage) outside of the "Urban
Limit Line" (as defined in the land use element, definition section of the Santa
Barbara County General Plan), or within the Carpinteria-Summerland Fire Protection
Distriet.

4.Modification to existing buildings and structures with 2 final floor area of 5,000
sqguare feet or more.
Existing buildings or_structures for which applications for modification are officially
filed or required to be filed with the Santa Barbara County Planning and Development
Department, Building and Safety Division and which are modified to add any scuare
footage and, subseguent to the addition, the total square footage of the building or
structure is 5,000 square feet or more; and

5.Modification to existing buildings and structures locaied outside the Urban
Limit Line.
Existing buildings or structures for which applications for modification are officially
filed or required to be filed with the Santa Barbara Couniy Planning and Development
Department, Building and Safety Division that are lacated outside of the "Urban Limit
Line" (as defined in the land use element. definition section of the Santa Barbara
County General Plan), or within the Carpenteris-Summerland Fire Protection District
and which are modified tc add five hundred square feet or more for non-residential
{notwithstanding Section 903.7 1#3) and add one thousand square feet or more for
residential.  Existing nonresidential and residential structures shall install sprinklers
throughout the structure when fire sprinklers are required.  However, Section
903.7.1#3 shall apply if the final gross floor area is 5,000 sguare feet or more.

*MOTE: Any additional square footage added after January 1°. 2011 shall be
aceumulative towards the totals listed in Section 803.7.1 #5 above.

Exceptions:
4. Section 903.7.1 shall not apply to any agricutural buildings, including greenhouses,
as _defined in the Caiifornia Building Code, which would otherwise be included within
the requirements of this section, provided that:
Whenever there is any change in the use or occupancy of such building so that it no
longer meets the above-listed definition of agriculiural building, the building must
have a sprinkler system installed prior to making such change of use or occcupancy in
all areas of the buiiding which would have been required o have sprinklers but for
the existence of the exception set out in this subsection:
Z._Other detached Group U buildings, as defined by the California Building Code, may
be exempted from Section 203.7.1 on a case-by-case basis in writing by the Fire Chief
and the Building Official (subject to the same occupancy change conditions as noted in
"Exception 1" above).
4. Buildings classified as Group $-2. as defined by the California Building Code, may
be exempied from Section 803.7.1 on a case-by-case basis in wiiting by the Fire Chief
in_accordance with Section 111.2.4 and/or Chapier 1 Section 104.9 of the 2010
California Fire Code (subject to the same occupancy change conditions as noted in
“Exception 1" above).

203.7.2 Floor area computation. The fotal floor area of such buildings or structures shall
be_within the ocutside perimeter of the exierior walls of the building under consideration,
exclusive of vent shafts and courts, without deduction for corridors, stairways, closets, the
thickness of interior walls, columns or other features. For all occupancies other than Group
R, Division 3 the floor area of a building, or portion thereof, not provided with surrounding
exterior walls shall be the usable area under the horizontal projection of the roof. floor
above or awning. _The gross floor area shall not include shafts with no openings or interior
courts.

15



pproval. No sutomatic . couires by this section shall be
installed without prior approval, by the fire chief ne plans for the installation, testing and
maintenance of the system. Svstem plars. incl :f g ion be approved
prior to system installation.

SECTION 905 STANDPIPE S8YSTEMS is amend
905.3 Reauired installations is amended by
the fire code official” at the end of the first sents

.

__,
b
&
-
=
o
=4
jo )
&)

'..and when recuired by

ihi CHAPTER 27 - HAZARDOUS MATER! £
by revising QF’C’[IO 2703.3.1.3 as follows:

5 is herebv amended

27034, iz Control. When an unauthorized discharae
is scovered, the involved primary containment « ,

vice end repaired or permarsentiy removed from fce,
15 33 - EXPLOSIVES AND FI hersby amended by revising Section
¢ adding Sections 3301.2 and 3301

¥ primary containment or svstem
shall be placed temporarily out

01 GENERAL

Explosives Bequirements. For exp
Code of Pequlailana Chapter 10.

3301.7 Prohibition of Fireworks. The manufeciuring, possession, storage. sale, use and

handling of anv and all ﬂreworks is prohibiied in all zreas within the Santa Barbara County

Fire Protection District and all other unincorporated areas of the County, \,wﬂm the areas

wiihin the Carpenteria/Summerland é"i.‘e: Protection District, Montecito Fire Protection
District, Vandenberg Air Force Base, and Sureasu of ndian Affairs Lands, un(ess otherwise
specified by this Chapter.

is, see Title 19 Califormiz

e e n

EACEPTION: A permitied Public Display of Fireworks, as defined in Section 12524 of the
Health and Safety Code, by a State Fire Ma r‘*m—;l ﬂcenae Pvyrotechnic operator. Public
Displays of Fireworks shall comply with Title 19 California Code of Regulations, Chapter
6 — Fireworks.

L6, FRIOVE oF cause o

3301.3 Seizure The fire code official is aut
he remwecﬁ fireworks in violation perday
of 3301.2 and/or CCR Title 19,

(ml} CHAPTER 49 — REQUIREMENTS FOR WILDL
hereby amended by including additional definitions i

FACE FIRE ARE

£ AS is
sectim 4702 1 and add ng Section 4714

Q’f“’

BUILDINGE AND STRUCTURES are thos
Chapter, whether inhabited or not.

' struciures, described within ihis

COMBUSTIBLE MATERIALS are weeds, stubble. brush. rubbish, litter, drv arass, dry
leaves or other flammable materials that are readilv ianitable and endanger the nublic
safety.

DEFENEIBLE SPACE is the area surrounding & structure or building where basic wildfire
protection praciices are implemented. providing the kev point of defense from an
approaching wildfire _or escaping structure fire. The area is characterized by the
establishment and maintenance of fuel modification measures.

16



FIRE HAZARD is anv thing or act that increases or could cause an increase of the hazard
or_menace of fire to a greater degree than that customarily recognized as normal by
persons in the public service reqularly enazged in preventing, suppressing or extinguishing
fire or any thing or act that could obstruct, deiay. hinder or interfere with the operations of
the fire department or the egress of occupants in the event of fire. When a Fire Hazard has
been determined to exist by the Fire Chief, the Fire Hazard shall be considered to be a
nuisance.

PARCEL is a portion of land of any size, the area of which is determined by the assessor's
maps and records and may be identified by an assessor's parcel number whether or not
any buildings or structures are present.

REDUCED FUEL ZONE is a fire break within 30 feet to 100 feet from each building or
strycture and is created by disrupting the vertical and/or horizontal continuity of flammable
and combustible vegetation with the goal of reducing fire intensity, inhibiting fire in the
crowns of trees, reducing the rate of fire spread, and providing a safer environmeni for
firefighters to suppress wildfire.

SECTION 4914 Santa Barbara County Fire Hazard Abatement is added to read as follows:

4£914.1 Applicability of article. The provisions of section 4914 shall be applicable io all
areas within the Santa Barbara County Fire Protection District and all other unincorporated
areas of the County, except the areas within the Carpenteria/Summeriand Fire Protection
District, Montecito Fire Protection District, Vandenberg Air Force Base, and Buresu of
indian Affairs Lands, unless otherwise specified by this Chapter, and those areas in
independent fire districts having governing bodies other than the Santa Barbara County
Board of Supervisors that choose o enforce this -section. I any part of this article is in
conflict with any other part_the more restrictive provisions shall be controlling.

4914.2 Prohibited disposal of combustible material. No person shall place  deposit or
dump combustible material, which in_the opinion of the code official constitutes = fire
hazard, on a parcel, whether or not he owns such parcel, or whether or not he so places,
deposits or dumps on such parcel with the consent of the owner thereof.

4914.3 Clearance of Brush, Vegelative Growth and Combustible Material from
Farcels, All parcels declared a fire hazard shall be cleared entirely of combustible
material_If the chief determines this impractical, the provisions of Section 4994 4 may bhe
used.

4914 .4 Clearance of Brush or Vegetative Growth from around Structures.
4814.4.1 Any person owning, leasing, controlling, operating or maintaining any building
in, Upon, or adjoining any mountainous area, forest-covered tands. brush-covered lands,
grass-covered lands, or any land that is covered with combustible material shall =i all
times:
(&} Maintain _around and adjacent to the building or struciure a firebreak made by
removing and clearing away, for a distance of not less than 30 feet on each side of the
building or structure or to the property line. whichever is nearer, all flammable
vegetation or other combustible growth.
(b) Maintain around and adjacent to the building or siructure a Reduced Fue! Zone
made by removing all brush, flammable vegetation, or combustible growth that is
located within 100 feet from the building or structure or to the property line. Grass and
other vegetation located more than 30 feet from the building or structure and less than
18 inches in height above the ground may be mainiained where necessary o stahilize
the soil and prevent erosion.
(c) Remove that portion of any tree that extends within 10 feet of the outlet of a
chimney or stovepipe.
(d) Maintain any tree adjacent to or overhanging a building free of dead or dying wood.

17



(el Maintain the roof of a structure free of leaves. needles,
Qrov\n}~

(f) Maintain compliance with Ca fomia Public
California Government Code Section 531182,

Resources Code Seclion 4281 and

Excepiions;

1. Sectlion 4814 .4 does not apply to agricultural crops, sincle specimens of
trees or other vegetation that is well-pruned and maintained 50_as fo
effectively manage fuels and not form a means of rapidly transmitting fire
from other nearby vegetation to a dwelling or structure.

2. In accordance with CEQA Guideline 15304(1), fuel management activities
shall not result in the taking of endancered, rare, or threatened plant
animal species or significant erosion and sedimentation of surface waters.

4914.5 Fire hazard deciared. The presence of combustible material on & narcel shall
when in the opinion of the fire chief, constitute a fire hazard.

4814.6 Prosecution.  The fire chief shall serve a writien order upon the owner or
possessor of a parcel, when, in his or her opinion, a fire hazard exisis upon & cel. The
order_shall identify the fire hazard and direct such owner of possessor 1o remove or abate
the fire hazard within a specified pericd of fime, but not less than ten days, afier such ord
is given. Every owner or possessor who fails or refuses o abate said fire hazard from suc
parcel within the time specified after being served with such order is quiliy of an infraction
as described in Santa Barbara County Code, Chapter 15, Article Vi, Evidence that the
current assessment roll of the County shows real property assessed {o a person shall
constitute prima facie evidence that such person is the owner of such property.

4814.7 Order to abate fire hazard -Notice, The chief shall send, by certified mail, a copy
of the written order providing information specified in Sec. 4914.6, and shall include an
assessor's parcel number of the parcel set forth on the county assessment roll, to the last
assessee of the parcel at the address given on such roll. In addition, the order shall provide
the specific date. time and location of when the Board of Supervisors of the County of
Santa Barbara will meet to hear the repori of the fire chief regarding the alleged fire hazard,
and include the following:
"WARNING: The Fire Chief has determined that a fire hazard exisis on this parcel.. if not
abated, the Fire Chief or his designee, shall enier and remove or abate the fire hazard by
cutting, burning or remeoving the flammable material. THE COST OF SUCH REMOCVAL
WILL BE COLLECTED BY ADDING T ONTO THE TAXES ASSESSED -’J\GAE\B&) T 1S
Parcel, ANY OWNER OR PCQS:SQOF%' INTENDING TO ABATE THIS FIRE HAZARD
AT HIS OWN EXPENSE SHOULD DO SO IMMEDIATELY .

The chief shall post sach rolice o abate, including the legal descrintion in some
conspicuous alace in the office of the clerk of the board of supervisors. It shall be the
respoensibility of the owner of record in the current assessment roll o notify anvy new owner
or possessor of the parcel of the noiice that was received and forward the notice to the new
owner or possessor of the parcel. it shall also be the respensibility of the current owner of
record tc notify the fire department of this change in ownership.

4814.8 Order {c sbate fire hazard--Posting Location. The chief may, in addition to
mailing, have a written order posted in front of anv parcel upon which & fire hazard exists,
or, it such parcel does not front upon any streel. highway or road, then either upon the
portion of such parcel nearest {0 a streel. highway or road or upon such portion that is likely
to give actual notice to the owner or lawful possessor.

18



4844.¢ Qrder o abate fire hazard--Posting Time. The order orovided for in Sec. 4914 8
shall be posted at least ten days before the board meets to hear the report of the chief
regarding the alleged fire hazard.

4914.10 Hearing. Al the time and place stated in the writien orders, the board shall meet
to_hear the report of the chief and any objections therelo. The chief or his desighated
representative shall attend, inform the board as to the sileged fire hazard and supply the
legal description of the parcel upon which it exists, the name and address of the last known
assessee thereof and state what he has done in order to give notice of the hearing
according to the provisions of this article. The board may continue from time fo time as it
sees fit,

48t4.11 Board of Supervisors’ direction to abate fire hazard. If, afler a hearing, the
board finds that a fire hazard exists upon a parcel, it may direct the chief to abate the
hazard. The board shall maintain a record of its proceedinas at such hearing and retain
therewith the report of the chief 2 legal description of such a2 ot or land and, where
available  the name and address of its last known assessee.

4914.12 Abatement procedure--Chief aulhorized to expend funds, coniract, ete. If the
board directs the chief to abate a fire hazard, he shall proceed to shate such hazard uniess
it has been abated, completely, before his agents arrive to beain such abatement. The chief
may expend appropriated funds for such abatement and may coniract with a person or
persons for the performance of the work of such abatement.

4214.13 Account of expenses--Report to be filad with the board. The chief shall keep
an account of his expenses when abating a fire hazard pursuant to the direction of the
board, and file a report with the board. The report shall include the assessor's tax area and
parcel numbers according to the county assessment roll of the parcel upon which such fire
hazard existed and, when available, the name and address of the last known assessee.
The report shall include a reasonable administrative cost in an_amount to be fixed by the
board frem time to time, based on administrative costs of carrving out these regulations.

4914.14 Account of expenses--Filing with clerk--Confirmation hearing. The report of
expenses referred to in section 4814.13 shall be maintained on file, open to public
inspection, in the cffice of the clerk of the board for at least ten days before a hearing of the
board to confirm such report. If any person shall, before the expiration of such ten days, file
a written request for notice of the hearing upon such confirmation, the board shall mail such
notice to the address supplied in any such written recuest. At the time fixed for such
hearing, the board shall meet to hear any objections to the report of expenses filed by the
chief as required by this section. At such hearing the board may make any modifications in
the amount it deems just, after which the report shall be confirmed.

4914.15 Expenses constitute special assessment and Hen. The amount of expenses
incurred by the chief for abating a fire hazard shall constitute a2 special assessment and a
lien against the parcel from which such hazard was remaved.

4914.16 Expense report to be transmitied to auditor-controlier. The board shall deliver
a copy of the expense report, as confirmed, to the auditor-controller of the county on aor
before August 1, following such confirmation.

4814.17 Inclusion of assessment on property tax bill--Disposition of revenue. The
county auditor-controller _shall enter the amount stated in the report as a special
assessment against the parcel described in the report. The tax collector of the county shall
include the amount of the assessment on the bill for taxes levied against the parcel. All
laws _applicable to the levy, collection and enforcement of county taxes are applicable to

19



such special assessments. Al special &
shall be accounted for as fire district revenu

ik) APPENDIX A — BOARD OF APPEALS is hereby amended by deleting all existing language
and inserting the following:

SECTION A101 GENERAL
A101.1 Scope. To determine the suitability of alternate materials and types of construction
and to provide reasonable interpretations of the provisions of this code, there shall be and
hereby is created a board of appeals.

A101.2 Membership and Appointment. The board of appeals shall consist of five
members who are qualified by experience and training to pass judgment upon pertinent
matters. The members shall be appointed by the Board of Supervisors and shall hold office
at their pleasure. Each member of the executive body has the right to appoint a member
that resides in or out of their supervisor district.

A101.3 Quorum. Three members shall constitute a quorum for a hearing.

A101.4 Clerk of the Board. The County Executive Office shall serve as the clerk of the
board of appeals.

A101.5 Rules and Regulations. The Board of Supervisors shall adopt reasonable rules
and regulations for conducting board of appeals hearings and investigations. The board of
appeals may adopt guidelines for the conduct of their hearings and investigations, as they
deem appropriate.

A101.6 Decisions. The board of appeals shall render decisions and findings in writing to
the fire chief, with a duplicate copy to the appellant. The decisions of the board of appeals
may be appealed de novo to the board of supervisors, at the option of the appellant or fire
chief, provided that, a request is made in writing to the clerk of the board of supervisors
within 20 days after the decision of the board of appeals was served on the parties. [f the
decision of the board of appeals is not appealed to the board of supervisors, it shall be final
and only subject to review by writ of mandate to the superior court. If the decision of the
board of appeals is appealed to the board of supervisors, the decision of the board of
supervisors shall be final and only subject to review by writ of mandate to the superior
court.

NOTE: If a majority of the board of supervisors determines that its prior involvement
with an appellant, prevents it from serving as a reasonably, impartial, non-involved
decision maker, it shall decline to hear the appeal. If the board of supervisors
declines to hear an appeal, the decision of the board of appeals shall be deemed
final and only subject to review by writ of mandate to the superior court.

A101.7 Terms of office. The term of office of a member of the board of appeals shall
coincide with the term of office of the County Supervisor that appointed the member.

A101.8 Stay of enforcement. The filing of an appeal application shall not stay an
enforcement order. However, the fire chief may modify, in his or her sole discretion, an

enforcement order during the pendency of an appeal.

A101.9 Subpoena powers. The subpoena powers of the Board of Supervisors set forth in
Article 9, Section 25170 et. seq. of the Government Code are delegated to the board of

20



appeals and shall apply to all hearings and investigations under the board of appeals’
jurisdiction.

A101.10 Fees. A fee of two hundred dollars shall be paid by the appellant to the clerk of
the board of appeals at the time of application for a hearing before the board of appeals. If
the decision of the board of appeals is appealed to the board of supervisors, an additional
fee of four hundred and forty-three dollars shall be paid by the appealing party, to the clerk
of the board of supervisors, at the time of application for a hearing before the board of
supervisors.

A101.11 Jurisdiction. This appeal process shall apply to disputes within the
unincorporated area of the fire district, within incorporated areas of the fire district and
within incorporated areas outside of the fire district where the fire department provides
service by contract. However, a city council of an impacted city, may adopt an alternative
procedure for reviewing decisions of the board of appeals.

(I} APPENDIX C -~ FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION is hereby amended by
adding the words ... and Santa Barbara County Fire Department De\fei@pmsnt Standards” after
the word "appendix” in Section C101.1.

{m} APPENDIX D - FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS is hereby amended by deleting all
existing language except SECTION 105 AERIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS.

Sec. 15-4. Findings with regard to geological, topographical and
climatic conditions.

The Board hereby finds that all amendments, including additions and deletions, to the CFC are
based upon the following geological, topographical and climatic conditions in the area protected
by the ceunty-fire-departmeniSanta Barbara County Fire Department. Those conditions inciude:

(a) That the seuntyfire-departmentSanta Barbara County Fire Department service area is
prone to extreme weather conditions, from hot dry winds from the east (Santa Ana and
Sundowner winds), to strong westerly (coastal) winds, which greatly enhance the ability for
fire to spread. In addition, the topographical layout and features of the sceunty fire
departmentsCounty Fire Department's service area makes the area subject to isolation
should a flood or earthquake occur, which would prevent or severely limit and delay the north
and south entities from giving or receiving mutual aid and emergency assistance;

(b) The present firefighting resources of this county are constrained in their efforts to control
fires in large unsprinkiered buildings within the urban limit line and all buildings outside of the
urban limit line as designated in the county comprehensive plan;

(c) Geologic and topographic conditions in the county result in extended response times for
firefighting resources, which may contribute to greater life and property loss in large
unsprinklered buildings within the urban limit line and in all structures outside of the urban
limit line; and

(d) Climatic conditions and flammable vegetation contribute to the extreme high fire hazard
severity in the county, resulting in numerous wildland fires, which draw existing fire
department resources from their structure protection areas for extended periods of time. This
in turn extends response times, which may contribute to greater life and property loss in large
unsprinklered buildings within the urban limit line and in all structures outside of the urban
limit line.

21



Article II.

£ e
el e B

aelf

vy

sy

TE ER AT BT

o}
P

[aFotmi

A1

W d ot P
FEEeaorr

S

-

Jo ey

jafact
[A™a™ [

q

FaVn Yot In

laRnTnl

S bvmdoey

LAt

YA S

TR R

o3 (K

[ Rwy oy v ¢

TS

T

vy

Aprtintn

il

A

FE )
S

Rt A
o

VaValoaV=Tati
EETE R AN i Ry B

o ln'y]

"‘I”
D YA T AR

DL

15
R

T

Ay
REQEHBEAMEMTO &

b

Fantin ya =g g

ARZAC
el A

LAY

-

i
T

T

LR =~ T}

[ A

g

7

[AapNTa ey gy oy 5]

T

22



wemain-unchanged]
{Remains Unchanged]

23



24



Article IV.
fReserved]
Chutomatic Fire-Sprinkler Systemshas-beendeleted from Articlo M —now-see
Chapter18-Article—Section-15-3{s}—amendment-to- CFC CHAPTER & FIRE
PROTECHOM SYSTEMS)

[Remaing Unch anged]

25



Article V.

Fees
Sec. 15-100. Applicability of article.

The fees set forth in this article shall be applicable to the corresponding inspection
services provided by the Santa Barbara County fire-desartmentFire Depariment.

Sec. 15-101. Fee schedule.

The fees contained in this section are based on the average amount of staff time required
for inspection, processing and issuance of each permit type.

(a) Operational Permits.

Permit Type Fee
105.6.1 Aerosol products $ 99
105.6.32 Amusement buildings
$ 99
$ 149
$ 198
105.6.43 Aviation Facilities $ 149
105.6.54 Carnivals and fairs
50-100 occupants $ 99
101-300 occupants $ 149
~over 300 occupants $ 297
105.6.85 Cellulose nitrate film $ 198
105.6.7 Combustible fibers 5 99
105.6.8 Compressed gases $ 99
105.6.9 Covered mall $ 149
105.6.10 Cryogenic fluids $ 99
105.6.11 Cutting and welding $ 99
105.6.12 Dry cleaning plants $ 99
105.6.13 Exhibits and trade shows $ 274
105.6.14 Explosives $ 206
105.6.16 Flammable or combustible liquids
1. Pipeline $ 137
2. To store Class | liquids >5 in, >10 out % 99
3. To store Class H or HI-A liquids >25 in, >60 out $ 99
4. Removal of Class [ or !l liquids from UST CUPA fees apply*
5. To install, construct, alter or operate $ 1,370
equipment, tanks, plants, terminals, wells, refineries, etc.
6. To place temporarily out of service a tank
usT CUPA fees apply™

26



AST - less than 1,320 gallons
AST ~ equal to or greater than 1,320 gallons
7. To change tank content type
8. To manufacture, process, blend or refine
9. Dispensing into fuel tanks of motor vehicles
10. Dispensing from tank vehicles to motor vehicles
105.6.17 Floor finishing
105.6.18 Fruit and crop ripening
105.6.19 Fumigation or thermal insecticidal fogging
105.6.20 Hazardous materials (see GrpsGroups 1-4 below)
Group 1 (see below)
Group 2 (see below)
Group 3 (see below)
Group 4 (see below)
105.6.21 High-piled-sterageHPM Fagilities
105.6.22 Hetwerk-cperationsHigh-piled sioraae
105.6.23 #RM-fasiliiesHot work operations
105.6.24 Industrial ovens
105.6.25 LE-gas-Lumber vards and woodworking plants
105.6.26 Liguid or gas fueled vehicles or equipment in
assembly buildings
105.6.27 Eemberyards-and-woodworking plantsLPG gas
105.6.28 Magnesium
105.6.29 Miscellaneous combustible storage
105.6.30 Open burning:
Agricultural
Backyard
High fire hazard
105.6.31 Open flames and torches
105.6.32 Open flames and candles
105.6.33 Organic coatings
105.6.34 Places of assembly
50-100 occupants
101-300 occupants
over 300 occupants
105.6.36 Pyrotechnic special effects material
105.6.37 Pyroxylin plastics
105.6.38 Refrigeration equipment
105.6.39 Repair garages and motor fuel-dispensing facilities
105.6.40 Rooftop heliports
105.6.41 Spraying or dipping
105.6.42 Storage of scrap tires and tire byproducts
105.6.43 Temporary membrane structures, tents and canopies
105.6.44 Tire re-building plants
105.6.45 Waste handling
105.6.46 Wood products
105.6.47 Additional permits (SFM required)
Production facilities

$ 137

$ 548

CUPA fees apply*
Actual cost (sec. 15-102)
99

99

99

99

198

e ©H H P &

99
198

248

297

198
-$8-198
198 99
274
98-149
99

A BB PP

-

146-99
198
99

@ &

50

50

50
99
99
99

@ N PP

929
149
198
274
198
99
99
Actual cost (sec. 15-102)
$ 99
$ 149
$ 137
Actual cost (sec. 15-102)
$ 149
$ 149

€ H PP

$ 137

27



Pyrotechnic and special effects $ 274
Live audiences $ 137

‘Fees for these permits are covered by the Certified Unified Program Agency's
(CUPA) Underground Storage Tank (UST) Program.

“*Fees for these permits are covered under the Land Use Permit fee schedule.

Group No. 1. $99.00 for any or all of the following:

1. Hazardous materials in excess of the amounts listed in Appendb-Chapter 1,

Table 105.6.20 and less than those listed in Groups 2.2, 2.3, 2.4, 3 & 4.

2. Cryogenic fluids, including flammables, oxidizers or corrosives (including

oxygen), in excess of the amounts listed in Appendix Chapter 1, Table 105.6.10.
Exception: Group 1 does not include fuel systems of vehicles or fuel used in
connection with oil-burning equipment.

Group No. 2. $198.00 for any or all of the following:

1. Any quantity of explosives, water reactive, pyrophoric or hypergolic materials,
highly toxic poisons;

2. 200 cubic feet or more but less than 2,000 cubic feet at standard temperature
and pressure for compressed gas;

3. 85 gallons or more but less than 550 gallons; or

4. 500 pounds or more but less than 5,000 pounds.

Group No. 3. $248.00 for any or all of the following:

1. 2,000 cubic feet or more but less than 10,000 cubic feet at standard
temperature and pressure for compressed gas;

2. 550 gallons or more but less than 2,700 gallons; or

3. 5,000 pounds or more but less than 25,000 pounds.

Group No. 4. $297.00 for any or all of the following:

1. 10,000 cubic feet or more at standard temperature or pressure for compressed
gas;

2. 2,700 gallons or more; or

3. 25,000 pounds or more.

(b} Construction Permits.

Permit Type Fee
105.7.1 Automatic fire-extinguishing systems See below**
105.7.2 Battery systems $ 274
105.7.3 Compressed gases $ 411
105.7.45 Fire alarm and detection systems and related equipment See below**
105.7.56 Fire pumps and related equipment See below**
105.7.67 Flammable or combustible liquids
1. To repair or modify a pipeline $ 274
2. To install, construct or alter equipment, tanks, plants, terminals, $ 1,370

wells, refineries, etc.
3. To install, alter, remove, abandon or otherwise dispose of a tank

28



usT CUPA fees apply*

AST —less than 1,320 gallons $ 274
AST - equal to or greater than 1,320 gallons $ 548
105.7.78 Hazardous materials (see GrpsGroups 1-4 below)
Group 1 (see below) $ 137
Group 2 (see below) $ 274
Group 3 (see below) $ 343
Group 4 (see below) $ 411
105.7.8g Industrial ovens $ 274
105.7.81
oLP gas $ 137
105.7.40
11 Private fire hydrants See below™*
105.7.11 Spraying or dipping $ 274
105.7.12 Standpipe systems See below™*
105.7.43 .
14 Temporary membrane structures, tents and canopies $ 137

*Fees for these permits are covered by the Certified Unified Program Agency'’s
(CUPA) Underground Storage Tank (UST) Program.

**Fees for these permits are covered under the Land Use Permit fee schedule.

Group No. 1. $137.00 for any or all of the following:

1. Hazardous materials in excess of the amounts listed in AppendixChapter 1,

Table 105.6.20 and less than those listed in Groups 2.2, 2.3, 2.4, 3 & 4.;

2. Cryogenic fluids, including flammables, oxidizers or corrosives (including

oxygen), in excess of the amounts listed in Appendix Chapter 1, Table 105.6.10.
Exception: Group 1 does not include fuel systems of vehicles or fuel used in
connection with oil-burning equipment.

Group No. 2. $274.00 for any or all of the following:

1. Any quantity of explosives, water reactive, pyrophoric or hypergolic materials,
highly toxic poisons;

2. 200 cubic feet or more but less than 2,000 cubic feet at standard temperature
and pressure for compressed gas;

3. 55 gallons or more but less than 550 gallons; or

4. 500 pounds or more but less than 5,000 pounds.

Group No. 3. $343.00 for any or all of the following:

1. 2,000 cubic feet or more but less than 10,000 cubic feet at standard
temperature and pressure for compressed gas;

2. 550 gallons or more but less than 2,700 gallons; or

3. 5,000 pounds or more but less than 25,000 pounds.

Group No. 4. $411.00 for any or all of the following:

1. 10,000 cubic feet or more at standard temperature or pressure for compressed
gas;

2. 2,700 gallons or more; or

3. 25,000 pounds or more.

Sec. 15-102. Surcharges.

29



circumstances develop that require extraordinary tlme for issues mcludmg but not hm;ted
to special research, consuiltation, or numerous inspections to ensure compliance.

Sec. 15-103. Petroleum facility response — Cost Recovery.

Petroleum Facility Operators shall pay a fee as specified below, for any response to their
petroleumn facility (and/or associated piping and wells) by the Sentz Barbara County F:re
Depariment that is caused by a violation of Chapter 27 (hazardeusHazardous Material) o
Chapter 34 (Flammable and Combustible Liquids) of Article 1 of Chapter 15 of the Santa Barbara
County Code. There shall be no fee for the initial response to a petroleum facility—heweves in a
calendar vear. However, a fee of $888712 shall be charged for each subsequent response to the
same-a _petroleum facility in a enecalendar year-peried. Additionally, if the time needed by
County Eire's-er-scene-respenseFire to mitigate the hazard caused by any violation exceeds two
hours, the Petroleum Facility Operator shall pay a surcharge based on County Fire's actual
response cosis.

Exception: Offshore related Petroleum facilities with Conditional Use Permits and regulated by
the seuntysCounty’s Systems Safety and Reliability Review Committee (SSRRC) are exempt
from Sec. 15-103.

30



Article VI.

Violations--Legal Actions

Sec. 15-121. Criminal actions.

(a) Any person who violates any of the provisions of this chapter of the Santa Barbara County
Code or fails to comply with any order made under this chapter or who builds in violation of any
plans submitted and/or reviewed under this chapter, or who violated the provisions of any
certificate or permit issued under this chapter, and/or who fails to comply with an order made
under the authority of this chapter, is, for each and every such violation and noncompliance
respectively, severally guilty of a crime. The offense may be filed either as an infraction or a
misdemeanor at the discretion of the district attorney.

(b) If filed as an infraction and upon conviction thereof, the crime shall be punishable by a fine not
to exceed one hundred dollars for a first violation, a fine not to exceed two hundred dollars for a
second violation of the same code provision within a period of one year, and a fine not to exceed
five hundred dollars for each additional violation of the same code provision within one year.

(c) If filed as a misdemeanor and upon conviction thereof, the crime shall be punishable by a fine
of not less than five hundred dollars nor more than twenty-five thousand dollars, or imprisonment
in the county jail for a period not to exceed ninety days, or by both such fine and imprisonment,
except that where such prior convictions, as either infractions or misdemeanors, are alleged in
the accusatory pleading, and either admitted by the defendant in open court, or found to be true
by a jury trying the case, or by the court in a case where guilt is established by a plea of guilty or
nolo contendere, or by trial by the court sitting without a jury, the punishment shall be a fine of not
less than one thousand dollars nor more than twenty-five thousand dollars, or imprisonment in the
county jail for a period not to exceed one hundred eighty days, or by both such fine and
imprisonment.

(d) Each and every day during any portion of which any violation of this chapter or the rules,
regulations, orders, or permits issued there under, is committed, continued or permitted by such
person, firm, or corporation shall be deemed a separate and distinct offense. (Ord. No. 3788; Ord.
No. 4494).

Sec. 15-122. Civil actionsfctions.

(a) Injunctive Relief. Whenever any person, firm, or corporation has engaged in or is
about to engage in any act or practice which constitutes or will constitute a violation of any
provision of this chapter or any rule, regulation, order, or permit issued there-under, the
district attorney, county counsel or district counsel may make application to the Superior
Court for an order enjoining such act or practice, or for an order directing compliance, and
upon a showing by the fire department that such person, firm, or corporation has engaged
in or is about to engage in any such act or practice, a permanent or preliminary injunction,
temporary restraining order, or other order may be granted.

(b) Abatement. In the event that any person, firm, or corporation shall fail to abate a
violation hereunder after notice of same and opportunity to correct or end the violation, the
district attorney, county counsel or district counsel may apply to the Superior Court of this
county for an order authorizing the fire department to' undertake those actions necessary
to abate the violation and requiring the violator to pay for the costs of such undertaking.
(Ord. No. 3788; Ord. No. 4494)

31



Sec. 15-123. Civil remedies and penalties.

(a) Civil Penalties. Any person, whether acting as principal, agent, employee, or
otherwise, who willfully violates any of the provisions of this chapter or any rule, regulation,
order or permit issued there-under, shall be liable for a civil penalty not to exceed twenty-
five thousand dollars for each day that the violation continues to exist.

(b) Costs and Damages. Any person, whether as principal, agent, employee or otherwise,
violates any of the provisions of this chapter or the rules, regulations, order or permits
issued there-under, shall be liable to the County of Santa Barbara for the costs incurred
and the damages suffered by the county, its agents, and agencies as a direct and
proximate result of such violation(s).

(c) Procedure. In determining the amount of the civil penalty to impose, the Court shall
consider all relevant circumstances, including, but not limited to, the extent of the harm
caused by the conduct constituting a violation, the nature and persistence of such conduct,
the length of time over which the conduct occurred, the danger to public health and safety,
the corrective action, if any, taken by the defendant and the assets, liabilities, and net
worth of the violator(s). (Ord. No. 3788; Ord. No. 4494)

Sec. 15-124. Cumulative remedies and penalties.

The remedies or penalties provided by this section are cumulative to each other and to the
remedies or penalties available under all other laws of this state. (Ord. No. 3788; Ord. No.
4494)

Sec. 15-125. Citations--Enforcement procedures.

Personnel assigned to the Bureau of Fire Prevention may be guided by the operating
procedures as outlined in the 28672010 CFC, AgpeadiChapter 1, Sec. 109 Violations
(Ord. No. 3788; Ord. No. 4494)

32



Article VII.

[Remains unchangedUnchanged]

33



[ ——— W wea 9

o

This_ordinance shzll take effect and he in force thirty days from the date of iis paszage. and

News Press the Lompoc Record and the Sants Maria Times, which are newspzpers of

circulation published in the County of Santa Barbara.”

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED this ___day of , 28882010, by the following vote:
AYES:
NOES:
ABSTAIN:
ABSENT:

Janet Wolf
Chair, Board of Supervisors

ATTEST:

MICHAEL BROWN
CHANDRA WALLAR
CLERK OF THE BOARD

By

Deputy

[DO NOT PUBLISH APPROVAL]

FHOMAS EFRANKLINMICHAEL W DYER
FIRE CHIEF
SANTA BARBARA COUNTY FIRE

By

APPROVED AS TO FORM: APPROVED AS TO ACCOUNTING FORM:
DENNIS A—-MARSHALL, ROBERT W. GEIS, CPA

COUNTY COUNSEL AUDITOR-CONTROLLER

By By

Deputy County Counsel






