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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

COMMSOL-01

SABADJIAN

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
9/6/2022

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT:

If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

Smi

PRODUCER

th Brothers Insurance, LLC.

68 National Drive
Glastonbury, CT 06033

CONTAC i ii
GQnTACT Silva Abadjian

THONE Ext): (860) 430-3375

FAX
{AIC, No):

Sl os. sabadjian@smithbrothersusa.com

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
iINsURER A : Philadelphia Indemnity 18058
INSURED iNsureRr B: StarNet Insurance Company 40045
Community Solutions, Inc INSURERC :
175 Addison Road, Suite 1E INSURER D :
Windsor, CT 06095
INSURERE :
INSURERF :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

ADDL|

SUBR|

POLICY EFF POLICY EXP

INSR TYPE OF INSURANCE s POLICY NUMBER (MMIDBNY YY) | (MBI YYY) LIMITS
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE s 1,000,000
| cLams-mae OCCUR X PHPK2459313 9/1/2022 | 9/1/2023 |DBAVAGETORENTED T 100,000
[ MED EXP (Any one person) S 5'000
L PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | S 1,000,000
| GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE s 2,000,000
poLicy FES: Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | § 2,000,000
—— EBL AGG s 1,000,000
A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY %‘g"ggyi\é%g”’s“\'GLE Limim s 1,000,000
X | any auTO PHPK2459313 9/1/2022 9/1/2023 | BODILY INJURY (Per person) | S
| OWNED SCHEDULED -
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | §
HIRED NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE
| | AUTGS ONLY AUTOS ONLY (Per accident) S
s
A | X |umereLLaLiag | X | occur EACH OCCURRENCE s 5,000,000
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE PHUB830714 9/1/2022 | 912023 [, oo S 5,000,000
peo | X [retenrions 10,000 s
PER OTH-
B iengranns, e | 1%
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE KEY0145381 7112022 | 7/112023 | | CacnaccipenT s 1,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? N/A 1.000.000
{Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE] s WY,
If yes, describe under 1,000,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | WY,
A |Prof $1M/$2M Abuse& PHPK2459313 9/1/2022 9/1/2023 [Mol. Each Occ $1M/Ag 3,000,000
A |Building $17,895,988 PHPK2459313 9/1/2022 9/1/2023 |BPP: $2,077,084/Bl 6,110,032

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)
Certificate Holder is included as an Additional Insured as required by written contract.

CANCELLATION

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

County of Santa Barbara

Sheriff's Office
4436 Calle Real

Santa Barbara, CA 93110-0000

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF,

ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

(Tl K
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Perez, Alice

From: Jennifer Shortridge - (CT) <jshortridge@csimail.org>
Sent: Wednesday, August 30, 2023 11:49 AM

To: Perez, Alice

Cc: Michael Heck - (CA)

Subject: Certificate of Insurance

Attachments: SB Sheriff's Office.pdf

Good afternoon Alice,
Please see attached for our current certificate of insurance.

I will send you our renewal once received.

Thank you,
Jennifer

Jennifer Shortridge
Director of Contracts

Office: (860) 683-7167

Cell: (860) 462-7544

Email: jshortridge@csimail.org
Web: www.csi-online.org

Comm_unity
Solutions:

Creating Opportunities.
Empawering Success.

The information contained in this transmission may contain privileged and confidential information, including client information protected by federal and
state privacy laws. It is intended only for the use of the person(s) named above. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
review, dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the
sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message.



